Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1085884

Vendor Name: HP Inc.

Invoice Number: 7750669834
Invoice Date: 08/24/21

PO Number:

Check Number: 0284780

Check Amount: $ 775.09

Check Date: 09/14/2021

Voucher Number: V0694747
Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: acctpay@cod.edu

To: Zeitz, Keith
Subject: Voucher Confirmation: V0694747
Date: Tuesday, August 24, 2021 2:09:07 PM

Voucher Number V0694747
Voucher Status In Progress (Unfinished)

Requestor Name Mr Keith J. Zeitz

Voucher Date  08/24/21 1‘ l) ‘T l? l{ l l;‘ l ]1" ]’
Due Date 08/24/21 - <4
Vendor ID and/or Name

108588 2 Ing.
wive ot sOB/25/21 - BETHANY CRUSE

Voucher Total $30.94

ITEM 1

Item Description  SPS DC IN - replacement DC port
Quantity 1.000

Price $30.9400

Extended Price $30.94
GL Distribution  01-90-16765-5304004
Tax Info

COMMENTS

Carmen Abermathy HD# 312370

Replacement DC port tor HP ProBook 450 G5

Part arrived and works as intended - Good for payment

APPROVAL DATE
Dsnna Buwbirer  8/24/2021

NEXT APPROVALS









Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1085884

Vendor Name: HP Inc.

Invoice Number: 7750669286
Invoice Date: 08/26/21

PO Number:

Check Number: 0284780

Check Amount: $ 775.09

Check Date: 09/14/2021

Voucher Number: V0694898
Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: acctpay@cod.edu

To: Zeitz, Keith
Subject: Voucher Confirmation: V0694898
Date: Thursday, August 26, 2021 4:19:51 PM

Voucher Number V0694898
Voucher Status In Progress (Unfinished)

Requestor Name Mr Keith J§ Zeitz

- AP VERIFIED
. oucher Date  08/26/21
Ve mandorvame 1ps@ B2 T /21 - BETHANY CRUSE

AP Type IM Invoices <§$15.000

Voucher Total $119.15

ITEM 1

Item Description ~ SPS-TOPCOVER with Keyboard
Quantity 1.000

Price $119.1500

Extended Price $119.15
GL Distribution  01-90-16765-5304004
Tax Info

COMMENTS

Shameica Hall - HD# 311988

Replacement top cover w/ keyboard for a HP EliteBook x360 830 G6
It arrived and works as intended. Good for payment. Per JH.

APPROVAL DATE
Denna Berlinaer 8/27/21

NEXT APPROVALS
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