Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices

Vendor Number: 1627804

Vendor Name: MPC Communications & Lighting
Invoice Number: 21-1222

Invoice Date: 08/20/21

PO Number:

Check Number: E0086066

Check Amount: $ 368.90

Check Date: 08/25/2021

Department 1D: 00697

Reviewer Name:

Voucher Number: V0694438

Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: Nehls, James <nehlsj156(@cod.edu>
Sent: Mon Aug 23 10:51:58 CDT 2021

To: acctpay@cod.edu,invoicing@cod.edu

&

Subject: FW: Voucher Confirmation: V0694438

R AP VERIFIED
this voucher was anroved fy B2 3/2 1 - BETHANY CRUSE

It signed on the invoice itself.
Thanks,

Deputy Chief James Nehls

College of DuPage Police Department
630-942-4277

nehlsjl56@cod.edu

-—--Original Message-----

From: acctpay@cod.edu

Sent: Friday, August 20, 2021 11:20 AM
To: Nehls, James

Subject: Voucher Confirmation: V0694438

Voucher Number V0694438
Voucher Status In Progress (Unfinished)

Requestor Name Mr James R. Nehls

Voucher Date 08/20/21

Due Date 08/27/21

Vendor ID and/or Name 1627804 MPC Communications & Lighting Inc
AP Type IM Invoices Voucher Total $368.90

ITEM 1

Item Description Gun Lock Repairs - squads
Quantity 2.000

Price $184.4500

Extended Price $368.90

GL Distribution 01-70-00697-5401005

Tax Info

COMMENTS

APPROVAL DATE
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