Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1405795

Vendor Name: Il Secretary of State Police
Invoice Number: UA42087 - title

Invoice Date: 08/17/21

PO Number:

Check Number: 0283976

Check Amount: $ 301.00

Check Date: 08/18/2021

Department 1D: 00697

Reviewer Name:

Voucher Number: V0694229

Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: Nehls, James <nehlsj156(@cod.edu>
Sent: Wed Aug 18 10:36:55 CDT 2021

To: invoicing@cod.edu

&

Subject: FW: Voucher Confirmation: V0694229

> -

God Mg AP VERIFIED
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A,

Thank you,

Deputy Chief James Nehls

College of DuPage Police Department
630-942-4277

nehlsjl56@cod.edu

-—--Original Message--—-

From: Mullin, Joseph

Sent: Tuesday, August 17, 2021 1:20 PM

To: Nehls, James

Subject: RE: Voucher Confirmation: V0694229

I approve this voucher.
Joe Mulin

-—--Original Message---—-

From: Nehls, James

Sent: Tuesday, August 17,2021 11:43 AM

To: Mullin, Joseph

Subject: FW: Voucher Confirmation: V0694229

Joe,
Can you approve this? I would like to get this check sent out with the documents needed for the Ford Focus.
Thanks,

Deputy Chief James Nehls

College of DuPage Police Department
630-942-4277

nehlsj156@cod.edu

-—--Original Message-----

From: acctpay(@cod.edu

Sent: Tuesday, August 17,2021 11:41 AM
To: Nehls, James

Subject: Voucher Confirmation: V0694229
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