Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1621955

Vendor Name: Community Unit District No 203
Invoice Number: PO374205

Invoice Date: 06/30/21

PO Number: P0374205

Check Number: 0282892

Check Amount: $ 4,375.00

Check Date: 07/13/2021

Department 1D: 04400

Reviewer Name: None

Voucher Number: V0689191
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice
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| am a bit confused, what exactly are you looking for? Do you need a spreadsheet on how we are spending the funds?

From: Jursinic, Maki <jursinicm@cod.edu>
Sent: Tuesday, June 29, 2021 11r3 A

To: Jill Hlavacek <jhlavacek@Nagerville203.org > " h
Cc: Marypat Shea <mshea@napgrville203.org> 1‘1’1’1{ ‘Tl‘dl)

Subject: FW: Invoice for SEPI graht pi n;ipt/(’ (;/2 l _ lJlSI‘ L."l‘('(j l‘

Importance: High
CAUTION: This e-mail originated outside of Naperville ; click links or open attachments unless you confirm the
; - incoming address of the sender and know the content is safe. o

Hi Jill,

I sent this email to Marypat last week, regarding your invoice to SEPI grant work. | haven’t heard from Marypat and we are
closing our fiscal year very soon. Can you please tell me who | need to contact so COD can receive your invoice on time?

Thank you.

Maki

From: Jursinic, Maki

Sent: Thursday, June 24, 2021 10:09 AM

To: 'Marypat Shea' <mshea@naperville203.org>
Cc: Zawlocki, April <zawlockia@COD.EDU >
Subject: Invoice for SEPI grant payment

Hello Ms. Marypat,

I am reaching out to you because we have not received your invoice for the SEPI grant activities. We have budgeted $4,375 to
NCUSD203 and the grant ends at 6/30. Would you be able to send the invoice to invoicing@cod.edu in the next week or two?
Please also include your PO number “P0374205”in the invoice. If you have any questions please feel free to contact me.

Thank you.

Maki Jursinic, CPA

Accounting Supervisor

College of DuPage

425 Fawell Blvd. Glen Ellyn, IL60137-6599
Phone: 630-942-3156

Fax: 630-942-2297

jursinicm@cod.edu

Confidentiality Notice: This message and any attachments may contain confidential and privileged information that is protected bylaw.
The information contained hereinis transmitted for the sole use of the intended recipient(s). If youare not the intended recipient or
designated agent of the recipient of such information, youare hereby notified that any use, dissemination, copying or retention of this
email or the information contained herein is strictly prohibited and may subject youto penalties under federal and/or state law. If you
received thisemail in error, please notify the senderimmediately and permanently delete this email. We may monitor email to and from
our network.

[attachment: SEPI Invoice 06.30.21.pdf]
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