Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1583962

Vendor Name: Lester and Rosalie Anixter Cen
Invoice Number: C71648-A

Invoice Date: 11/01/19

PO Number:

Check Number: 0279147

Check Amount: $ 6.00

Check Date: 04/13/2021

Department 1D: 00469

Reviewer Name: Tonia Metoyer
Voucher Number: V0640649
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



From: AR(@anixter.org
Sent: Wed Aug 26 11:38:19 CDT 2020

To: morcing(@cod.edu b
sidi st APPROVED

"""" 08/277/20 - SAMANTHA SALVATO
Pery i Lioual ds

If you need further assistance, please let us know.

Thank you,
Chwistina Cuevasy
773-977-1247

Christina Cuevas | Chicago Hearing Society

Chicago Hearing Society, a Division of Anixter Center
1444 W Willow St. | Chicago, lllinois 60642
www.AR@Anixter.org

'CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This transmission and any documents accompanying this transmission may
contain personal information subject to such privacy regulations as the Health Insurance Portability and
Accountability Act of 1996 (HIPAA) and by Federal confidentiality rules (42 CFR Part 2). This information is
intended only for the use of the authorized individual named above. Such authorized recipient of this
information is prohibited from disclosing this information to any other party unless required to do so by law or
regulation. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosures, copying,
distribution, or action taken in reliance on the contents of these documents is strictly prohibited. If you have
received this information in error, please notify the sender immediately and arrange for the destruction of these
documents. The Federal rules prohibit you from making any further disclosure of this information unless
further disclosure is expressly permitted by written consent of the person to whom it pertains or as otherwise
permitted by 42 CFR Part 2. A general authorization for the release of medical or other information is not
sufficient for this purpose. Thank you for your cooperation.'









Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1583962

Vendor Name: Lester and Rosalie Anixter Cen
Invoice Number: C71651-A

Invoice Date: 11/01/19

PO Number:

Check Number: 0279147

Check Amount: $ 6.00

Check Date: 04/13/2021

Department 1D: 00469

Reviewer Name: Tonia Metoyer
Voucher Number: V0640651
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



From: AR(@anixter.org

Sent: Wed Aug 26 11:48:27 CDT 2020
To: invoicing@cod.edu

CC: cruseb199@cod.edu

Subject: C71651 CREDIT a.pdf

APPROVED
08/27/20 - SAMANTHA SALVATO

L imatiee e
773-977-1247

s
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Christina Cuevas | Chicago Hearing Society

Chicago Hearing Society, a Division of Anixter Center
1444 W Willow St. | Chicago, lllinois 60642
www.AR@Anixter.org

'CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This transmission and any documents accompanying this transmission may
contain personal information subject to such privacy regulations as the Health Insurance Portability and
Accountability Act of 1996 (HIPAA) and by Federal confidentiality rules (42 CFR Part 2). This information is
intended only for the use of the authorized individual named above. Such authorized recipient of this
information is prohibited from disclosing this information to any other party unless required to do so by law or
regulation. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosures, copying,
distribution, or action taken in reliance on the contents of these documents is strictly prohibited. If you have
received this information in error, please notify the sender immediately and arrange for the destruction of these
documents. The Federal rules prohibit you from making any further disclosure of this information unless
further disclosure is expressly permitted by written consent of the person to whom it pertains or as otherwise
permitted by 42 CFR Part 2. A general authorization for the release of medical or other information is not
sufficient for this purpose. Thank you for your cooperation.'









Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1583962

Vendor Name: Lester and Rosalie Anixter Cen
Invoice Number: C77140

Invoice Date: 10/14/20

PO Number:

Check Number: 0279147

Check Amount: $ 6.00

Check Date: 04/13/2021

Department 1D: 00469

Reviewer Name: Tonia Metoyer
Voucher Number: V0657720
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



From: Cruse, Bethany <druseb199@cod.edu> 1‘1’1’1{("7151)

Sent: Tue Jan 05 14:42:3

imengacodets | 01/26/21 - SAMANTHA SALVATO

Subject: FW: Invoice for T07Z

From: Ebersold, Sheryl <ebersold@cod.edu>

Sent: Tuesday, January 5,2021 2:09 PM

To: Salvato, Samantha <salvatos24@cod.edu >; Cruse, Bethany <cruseb199@cod.edu >
Subject: Invoice for 10/2

Here is the invoice let me know if you need anything else.

--Sheryl Ebersold

[attachment: COD 77140.pdf]






Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1583962

Vendor Name: Lester and Rosalie Anixter Cen
Invoice Number: C78821

Invoice Date: 02/26/21

PO Number:

Check Number: 0279147

Check Amount: $ 6.00

Check Date: 04/13/2021

Department 1D: 00469

Reviewer Name: Tonia Metoyer
Voucher Number: V0664186
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



From: Accounts Receivable <AR@anixter.org >
Sent: Fri Mar 05 15:45:52 CST 2021

To: invoicing@cod.edu

i

Subject: [External] FEBRUARY 2021 INVOICE

APPROVED

= \d \

CAUTION: This emailpriginated from outside of COD’s system. Do not click links, open attachments, or respond with sensitive
information unless you émgmwm

Attached please find your February 2021 invoice(s) from the Chicago Hearing Society.

We thank you for choosing the Chicago Hearing Society and deeply appreciate your business. Should you
discover a reason that our invoice(s) cannot be processed for payment, please contact AR@ Anixter.org.

Please note that the remittance address is Chicago Hearinlg Society, 1444 W. Willow St, Chicago, Illinois,
60642. You also have the option to pay, via credit card at www.Chicagohearingsocictv.org. , pay an

invoice, located on top of web page. As a friendly reminder our payment terms are Net 30 unless other
arrangements have been made.

In an effort to build a collaborative relationship between the Chicago Hearing Society and your organization,
please review all of the identifying information presented to ensure that it is both current and complete. Should
there be a need for any changes, please feel free to e-mail these changes to AR@ Anixter.org so that our
records can be updated accordingly. Your time and attention given to this matter is deeply appreciated.

Thank vou for taking the time to complete this survey:

https://www.survevmonkev.com/r/MV7LS33

In an effort to better serve our customers, we deeply appreciate you taking time to complete our satisfaction
survey which is contained on the link above. Thank you for sharing your valuable time, honest information
and thoughtful suggestions.

Notice of Confidentiality: **This E-mail is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to which it is
addressed. If you are not the intended recipient of this E-mail, you are hereby notified that any
dissemination, distribution, copying, or action taken in relation to the contents of and attachments to this E-
mail is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this E-mail in error, please notify the
sender immediately and permanently delete the original and any copy of this E-mail and any printout. Thank
You.*

Providing communication access; hearing and assistive technologies; and support services for persons who
are Deaf, DeafBlind and Hard of Hearing.

Thank you,

Christina Cuevas
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