Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1265383

Vendor Name: Critical Reach, Inc.
Invoice Number: 1162

Invoice Date: 12/08/20

PO Number:

Check Number: 0275693

Check Amount: $ 250.00

Check Date: 01/12/2021

Department 1D: 00697

Reviewer Name:

Voucher Number: V0656629
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: acctpay(@cod.edu
Sent; Wed Dec 09 16:13:32 CST 2020
To: invoicing@gfod.edu B

ac: APPROVED

Subject: FW: Irfvoices

12/10/20 - JOSEPH MULLIN

From: Nehls, James <nehlsj156@cod.edu>
Sent: Wednesday, December 39,2020 3:32 PM
To: Accounts Payable <acctpay@cod.edu >
Subject: FW: Invoices

See below email for approval.

Deputy Chief Jim Nehls

College of DuPage Police Department
630-942-4277

nehlsj156@cod.edu

From: Mullin, Joseph <mullin@cod.edu>

Sent: Wednesday, December 09, 2020 3:29 PM
To: Nehls, James <nehlsj156@cod.edu>
Subject: Re: Invoices

Jim,
While I can’t physically sign these two invoices, | approve them both. Please use this email as verification of

that approval.
Joe

On Dec 9, 2020, at 10:48 AM, Nehls, James <nehlsj156(@cod.edu> wrote:

O

Joe,

| completed a requisition for the federal ‘use of force’ certificate, and when | asked Purchasing how to change a Vendor
address in the system, they indicated that the requisition and/or Voucher is not needed now.

They indicated that checks for less than $500, just send a signed Invoice with GL# to Accounts Payable — no voucher
form.

If you sign the attached two Invoice, I'll send to Accounts Payable.
Note: You can delete the requisition that is pending in Mercury.
Thanks,

Deputy Chief Jim Nehls
College of DuPage Police Department
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