Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1047593

Vendor Name: Mr Stephen M. Karesh
Invoice Number: COD-04302020
Invoice Date: 05/01/20

PO Number:

Check Number: 0267860

Check Amount: $ 270.00

Check Date: 05/12/2020

Department ID: 00221

Reviewer Name:

Voucher Number: V0621750
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: cruseb199(@cod.edu

Sent: Tue May 05 11:19:45 CDT 2020

To: invoicing@cod.edu

B

Subject: FW: voucher - Stephen M. Karesh

AP VERIFIED
rrom: Gonzalez, Colee <A}/ 20 - BETHANY CRUSE

Sent: Tuesday, May 5, 220 11:17 AM
To: Zerrudo, Maria <zerrudom(@cod.edu>; Cruse, Bethany <cruseb199@c0d.edu>
Subject: RE: voucher - Stephen M. Karesh

Here is the voucher that I already created. Does that help?

Voucher Number V0621750

Voucher Status In Progress (Unfinished)

Requestor Name Ms Colleen E. Gonzalez

Voucher Date 05/01/20

Due Date 05/02/20

Vendor ID and/or Name 1047593 Mr Stephen M. Karesh
AP Type IM Invoices < $15,000

Voucher Total $270.00

ITEM 1

Item Description Nuclear Med prep exam

Quantity 6.000

Price $45.0000

Extended Price $270.00

GL Distribution 01-10-00221-5401002

COMMENTS

WARNING: All line items on this document have been populated with default tax form information from the chosen vendor.
APPROVAL DATE

NEXT APPROVALS

Thank you,

Colleen Prola-Gonzalez

Program Support Specialist, Nursing and Health Sciences Division
College of DuPage | 425 Fawell Blvd | Glen Ellyn, IL 60137
prolac@cod.edu | 630-942-2994 (ph) | 630-942-4222 (fax)

From: Zerrudo, Maria <zerrudom@cod.edu>

Sent: Tuesday, May 5, 2020 11:16 AM

To: Gonzalez, Colleen <prolac@cod.edu>; Cruse, Bethany <cruseb199@cod.edu>
Subject: RE: Stephen M. Karesh

Hi Colleen,

That is the one | routed to Bethany cause it falls under her alphabet. haven’t started the voucher entry.

I just wanted to be sure the right vendor name.





















Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1047593

Vendor Name: Mr Stephen M. Karesh
Invoice Number: COD-04302020
Invoice Date: 05/01/20

PO Number:

Check Number: 0267860

Check Amount: $ 270.00

Check Date: 05/12/2020

Department ID: 00221

Reviewer Name: Colleen Gonzalez
Voucher Number: V0621750
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



APPROVED
05/16/20 - DILYSS GALLYOT

Voucher Number V0621750
Voucher Status In Progress (Unfinished)

Requestor Name Ms Colleen E. Gonzalez

Voucher Date  05/01/20

Due Date 05/02/20

Vendor ID and/or Name 1047593 Mr Stephen M. Karesh
AP Type IM Invoices < $15,000

Voucher Total $270.00

ITEM 1

Item Description  Nuclear Med prep exam
Quantity 6.000

Price $45.0000

Extended Price $270.00
GL Distribution  01-10-00221-5401002

COMMENTS
WARNING: All line items on this document have been populated with default tax form
information from the chosen vendor.

APPROVAL DATE

NEXT APPROVALS

INVOICE REVIEWED
OKAY TO PAY
COLLEEN GONZALEZ 05/04/20




Consultants in Nuclear Medicine
2910 W. Estes Avenue
Chicago, IL 60645

(773) 802-7617 (OFFICE) E-MAIL: nucmedconsultants@comcast.net (315) 292-5917 (FAX)

INVOICE

Invoice Number: COD-04302020 Invoice Date: April 30, 2020

lleen Prola Gonzalez

f-‘ l) l’ 1{6 port Specialist

ollege of DuPage

05/16/20 - DIEYSSGALLYOT

Service Rendered Quantity Unit Cost ($) Extended Total ($)

Provision of four 100-question 6 45.00 270.00
On-line self-grading tests on

Nuclear Medicine Basic Science

And a 35-question test on

Mathematical Prroblem Solving

Unlimited access to 40+ on-line tutorials

With self-grading tests on our website 6 0.00 0.00
At www.nucmedtutorials.com

GRAND TOTAL: $270.00

INVOICE REVIEWED
OKAY TO PAY
COLLEEN GONZALEZ 05/04/20
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