Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1347097
Vendor Name: Mariani Nurseries
Invoice Number: SBI-28813
Invoice Date: 05/02/19

PO Number: B0368442

Check Number: 0266668

Check Amount: $2,915.00
Check Date: 04/14/2020
Department ID: 00713

Reviewer Name: Kathy Striplin
Voucher Number: V0607874
Redaction Type: None
Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



From: mechelle@cod.edu

Sent: Tue Mar 10 12:44:54 CDT 2020
To: invoicing@cod.edu

CC:

Subject: BO368442

-----Original Message---—-

scanned and sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction Printer. Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page

Multifunction Printer Location: CMC 1031 Device Name: Printer-083

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf]

From: mechelle@cod.edu Sent: Tuesday, March 10, 2020 12:42 PM To: Mechelle,
Valerie Subject: Scanned fiom a Xerox Multifunction Printer Please open the attached document. 1t was



Kenosha, Wi

13715 Horton Road
Kenosha, Wi 53142

Invoice

www.marianiplants.com

MARIANI
PLANTS

. SOLD TO:

COLLEGE OF DUPAGE
425 FALWELL BLVD
GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137

(866) 627-4264

NO GUARANTEE ON WHOLESALE ORDERS
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Invoice - Subtotal: 1,284.00
Discount Given: 0.00
Subtotal: 1,284.00
s Tax: 86.67
DELIVERY NOTE BLU Freight| 208.00
Total Amt Due: 1,492.00
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Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1347097
Vendor Name: Mariani Nurseries
Invoice Number: SBI-28812
Invoice Date: 05/02/19

PO Number: B0368442

Check Number: 0266668

Check Amount: $2,915.00
Check Date: 04/14/2020
Department ID: 00713

Reviewer Name: Kathy Striplin
Voucher Number: V0607875
Redaction Type: None
Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



From: mechelle@cod.edu

Sent: Tue Mar 10 12:44:54 CDT 2020
To: invoicing@cod.edu

CC: ,

Subject: BO363442

Multifunction Printer Location: CMC 1031 Device Ndme Printer-083

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf]

Original Message----- From: mechelle@cod.edu Sent: Tuesday, March 10, 2020 12:42 PM To: Mechelle
Valerie Subject; Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer Please open the attached document. 1t was

scanned and sent to you-using a Xerox Multifunction Printer. Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page



ﬁ -~ Kenosha, WI Invoice
13715 Horton Road :
m Kenosha, W1 53142

www.marianiplants.com

MARIANI &
PLANTS

NO GUARANTEE ON WHOLESALE ORDERS _
§ OB R O ﬁza& ,mm%w‘ e
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SOLD TO: SHIP TO:

" CULLEGE UF DUPAGE T COLLEGE OF DUPAGE
425 FALWELL B 425 FALWELL BLVD
GLEN ELLYN, d‘i’ l’ l{("rP ]) GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137

03/ 16/20 - DIRK HEID
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. INVOICE REVIEWED
OKAY TO PAY
KATHY STRIPLIN 03/16/20

All billing inquiries are handled at our Kenosha office at 866-627-4264.
*Claims on shortages, Incorrect or damaged plants must be submitted immediately. All other claims must be made In writing within 7 days of receipt.
*In no event, regardless of cause, shall Marlanl Plants be liable {beyand the wholesale value of nursery stock sold) for indirect, special, incidental,
punitive or consequential damages of any kind caused by the purchaser's use or intended use of such purchased nursery stock,

1/15/2020 2:10:52 PM Page 1 of 1 - invoice







Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1347097
Vendor Name: Mariani Nurseries
Invoice Number: SBI-28667
Invoice Date: 04/29/19

PO Number: B0368442

Check Number: 0266668

Check Amount: $2,915.00
Check Date: 04/14/2020
Department ID: 00713

Reviewer Name: Kathy Striplin
Voucher Number: V0607876
Redaction Type: None
Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



From: mechelle@cod.edu

Sent: Tue Mar 10 12:44:54 CDT 2020
To: invoicing@cod.edu

CC:

Subject: BO368442

- -—---Original Message-—-- From: mechelle@cod.edu Sent: Tuesday,' March 10, 2020 12:42 PM To: Mechelle,

Valerie Subject: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer Please open the attached document. 1t was
scanned and sent to yon using a Xerox Multifunction Printer. Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page

Multifunction Printer Location: CMC 1031 Device Name; Printer-083

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf]



ﬁ- W Kenosha, Wi .
. 13715 Horton Road
m' Kenasha, WI 53142

www.marianiplants.com

MARI AN I (868) 627-4264
PLANTS

4 y SHIP TO:
COLLEGml..lD () ) COLLEGE OF DUPAGE
425 FAL li{ ‘ ] l) 425 FALWELL BLVD
GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137 GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137

03/16/20 - DIRK HEID

INVOICE REVIEWED
OKAY TO PAY
KATHY STRIPLIN 03/16/20

Al billing inquiries are handled at our Kenosha office at 866-627-4264.

*Claims on shortages, incorrect or damaged plants must be submitted immediately. All other claims must be made in writing within 7 days of receipt.
*in no event, regardless of cause, shall Marlant Plants be liable (beyond the wholesale value of nursery stock sold) for indiract, special, incidental,
punitive or consequential damages of any kind caused by the purchaser’s use or intended use of such purchased nursery stock,

1/15/2020 2:10:52 PM Page 1 of 1 ”!nvo!c-é






Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1347097
Vendor Name: Mariani Nurseries
Invoice Number: SBI-28621
Invoice Date: 04/29/19

PO Number: B0368442

Check Number: 0266668

Check Amount: $2,915.00
Check Date: 04/14/2020
Department ID: 00713

Reviewer Name: Kathy Striplin
Voucher Number: V0607877
Redaction Type: None
Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



From: mechelle@cod.edu

Sent: Toe Mar 10 12:44:54 CDT 2020
To: invoicing@cod.edu

cC:

Subject: BO368442

-----Original Message----- From: mechelle@cod.edu Sent: Tuesday, March 10, 2020 12:42 PM To: Mechelle,
Valerie Subject: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer Please open the attached document. It was
scanned and sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction Printer. Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page
Multifunction Printer Location: CMC 1031 Device Name: Printer-083

[attachment; Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf]



" Kenosha, Wi Invoice
M 13715 Horton Road
3 Kenosha, Wl 53142 1

www.marianiplants,com

M A R I A N I _ (866) 627-4264
PLANTS

NO GUARANTEE ON WHOLESALE ORDERS _

[ .
s AP ROVED - ColLeet o bupace
425 FALWELL BLVD
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(lKAY TO PAY
KATHY STRIPLIN 03/16/20

Invoice e O, DA Subtotal: 408.50
; Discount Given: 0.00]
Subtotal: 408.50
. S e i R i ey SRR ST v iy o e Tax: 27.57
DELIVERY NOTE _ Freight 88.00
Total Amt Due;) 496.50
‘ E & OE

All billing inquinies are handied at our Kenosha office at 866-627-4264.

“Claims on shortages, incorrect or damaged plants must be submitted immediately, All other claims must be made in writing within 7 days of receip:
*In no event, regardiess of cause, shall Mariani Plants be liable (beyond the wholesale value of nursery stock sold) for indirect, special, incidental,
punitive or consequential damages of any kind caused by the purchaser's use or intended use of such purchased nursery stock.

1/15/2020 2:10:52 PM Page 1 of 1 Invoice
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