Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1272903

Vendor Name: Press Photography Network
Invoice Number: 1876

Invoice Date: 10/16/18

PO Number:

Check Number: E0070288

Check Amount: $ 1,625.00

Check Date: 11/14/2018

Department ID: 12241

Reviewer Name:

Voucher Number: V0541570

Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: junokasm(@cod.edu

Sent: Tue Nov 06 13:26:45 CST 2018

To: junokasm(@cod.edu,invoicing(@cod.edu

oe:

Subject: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Device

Please open the attached document. It was scanned and sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction Device.
Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page Multifunction Printer Location: AR201WC7835 Device Name:
PRN303

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf]



(D College of DuPage

Welct me Moilyl

11/08/18 - BE¥HANY CRUSE

x::mm ::;:ezﬁuwnmmnm E-MAILED NOV 0 6 2018
her Stalus  In Progr (Unfinishad) AP Type IM involcas < $15,000

Voucher Dale  11/06/18  Voucher Maintenance Dste  11/08/18 Due Date  11/08/18
Involes Number 1878  Involca Date  10/18/18
Check/Transaction Number Paid Data

Created from Document

Vendor Extended GL Distribution Invoice Tax Tax Comments

Unit of
Quantity esiia Price Brice

myACCESS



Press Photography Network

28W436 Juanita Dr

Naperville, IL 60564 US

(630)917-1288
press.photonetwork@gmail.com
hitp://iwww .pressphotographynetwork.com

L TR TN Y
\/OYIC =

|

INVOIUE
BILLTO

College of DuPage
College of DuPage
425 Fawell Blvd,

Glen Ellyn, lllincis 60137
USA

Photography Services
COD MAC: Oct. 15 — DuPage Community Concert Band

Post
Post Production:

Photographer: Corey R. Minkanic

1.50

BALANCE DUE

ol - 30- [aa4l —530900]
Q5 PHOTOGRAPHY CINIT— DPCOBAN @/

M/Mu Mh_)ﬂ.,\_z

E-MAILED NOV O 6 2018
VOUCHEEHEVQSHSTD

INVOICE # 1876 |
DATE 107/16/2018
DUE DATE 11/15/2018

TERMS Net 30

125.00 125.00

125.00 187.50

$312.50

lifos(18



Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1272903

Vendor Name: Press Photography Network
Invoice Number: 1878

Invoice Date: 10/09/18

PO Number:

Check Number: E0070288

Check Amount: $ 1,625.00

Check Date: 11/14/2018

Department ID: 12241

Reviewer Name:

Voucher Number: V0541630

Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: junokasm(@cod.edu

Sent: Tue Nov 06 13:26:32 CST 2018

To: junokasm(@cod.edu,invoicing(@cod.edu

oe:

Subject: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Device

Please open the attached document. It was scanned and sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction Device.
Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page Multifunction Printer Location: AR201WC7835 Device Name:
PRN303

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf]



Walcome Molyl

11/08/18 - BEEHANY CRUSE

::u:;mNm ::gmr-mmum E-MAILED Nov 0 6 2018

Voucher Status  In Progress (Unfinished} AP Type IM Involces < $15,000

Voucher Dats  11/08/18 Voucher Maintenance Date 11/06/18 Due Date 11/08/18
Invoice Number 1678 invoice Date  10/09/18

ChackfTransaction Number  Pald Dats

Created from Document

Ig:r: s mdor Quantity Unitol ... Extended GL Distribution Involce Tax Tax  oomment

Issue Price Number  Codes Info

Approval Dats  Next Approval

f/lﬁk 3 '7%[_) M._/
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otography Network

e

 Pre:
28W436 Juanita Dr
Naperville, IL 60564 US
(630)917-1288 @; PPN
press.photonetwork@gmail.com Mg sty

hitp://www.pressphotographynetwork.com

E-MAILED NOV 0 6 2018

IRIN NI T
INVOILE

VOUCHERH VD SH 3D
BILL TO 7 INVOICE # 1878 3
College of DuPage T

DUE DATE 11/18/2018

College of DuPage
TERMS Net 30

425 Fawell Blvd,
Glen Ellyn, lllinois 60137

USA
Photography Services 1.50 125.00 187.50
Faculty Recital @ COD/MAC: 10-18-18
Post 1 125.00 125.00

Post Production

$312.50 |

Photographer: Corey R. Minkanic BALANCE DUE

_30- 1334l — 530900/
g 555{/)#0706&9///‘/ CMN9-FACALTY ]

I[oe[8




Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1272903

Vendor Name: Press Photography Network
Invoice Number: 1885

Invoice Date: 10/24/18

PO Number:

Check Number: E0070288

Check Amount: $ 1,625.00

Check Date: 11/14/2018

Department ID: 12271

Reviewer Name:

Voucher Number: V0541785

Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: junokasm(@cod.edu

Sent: Wed Nov 07 15:58:45 CST 2018

To: junokasm(@cod.edu,invoicing(@cod.edu

oe:

Subject: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Device

Please open the attached document. It was scanned and sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction Device.
Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page Multifunction Printer Location: AR201WC7835 Device Name:
PRN303

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf]



@ College of DuPage

11/09/18 - BETHEANY CRU SE

Welcome Mally!

Voucher Number V0541785
Voucher Amount $250.00
Vandor ID and/or Nama 1272903 Prass Photography Network

E-MAILED NOV O 72018

Voucher Stalus  In Progress (Unfinished) AP Type IM Invoices < $15,000
Voucher Date  11/07/18 Voucher Malntenance Date  11/07/18 Due Date 11/08/18
Involce Number 1885 Invoice Date  10/24/18

Check/Transaction Number Paid Date

Created from Document
Item

Vendor Invoice Tax

Quantity YMtof  price E"““"“’ GL Distribution

T

Next Approvi

Approval Date
rol, 10/23/18 |

phy CT18_CHRISTMS

Tax

Comments

Fll> ,(!4——-’

myACCESS




Press Photography Network

28W436 Juanita Dr

Naperville, IL 60564 US

(630)917-1288
press.photonetwork@gmail.com
http://www.pressphotographynetwork.com

& PPN

TRESS PHITOCRAPHY NETWORK
A ¥imu) Pirka Rasiveny

E-MAILED NOV 0 72018

VOUCHERH VDS 785
BILL TO ANVOICE # 1885
College of DuPage DATE 10/24/2018
College of DuPage DUE DATE 11/23/2018
425 Fawell Blvd, TERMS Net 30
Glen Ellyn, lllinois 60137
USA
Photography Services 2 125.00 250.00
COD/MAC: Press Photos for Christmas Carol: 10-23-18:
Base Rate
Photagrapher: Corey R. Minkanic BALANCE DUE

0l -30- 1321[- 5307001
QS PHoOTOGEAPHY CTIT-CHRISITILS

éﬂu 7%0 y%w/m )

ifor/r8



Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1272903

Vendor Name: Press Photography Network
Invoice Number: 1884

Invoice Date: 10/24/18

PO Number:

Check Number: E0070288

Check Amount: $ 1,625.00

Check Date: 11/14/2018

Department ID: 12271

Reviewer Name:

Voucher Number: V0541787

Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: junokasm(@cod.edu

Sent: Wed Nov 07 15:58:37 CST 2018

To: junokasm(@cod.edu,invoicing(@cod.edu

oe:

Subject: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Device

Please open the attached document. It was scanned and sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction Device.
Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page Multifunction Printer Location: AR201WC7835 Device Name:
PRN303

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf]



(D COl'ege of D'..:ragdr.:

Welcome Wollyl

Voucher Number V0541787

Vaucher Amaunt $375.00 E-MAILED NOV O 7 2018

Vendor ID and/or Name 1272903 Press Photography Network

Voucher Status  In Progress (Unfinished) AP Type  IM Invoices < $15,000

Voucher Date  11/07/18 Voucher Maintenance Date  11/07/18 Due Date 11/08/18
Invoice Number 1884 Invoice Date 10/24/18

Check/Transaction Number Paid Date

Created from D "
Vendor

Tax
P ri: Comments

Ouanﬂty Unit of Price Extended GL Distribution

Appraval Date Next Approval

myACCESS



Press Photography Network
28W436 Juanita Dr
Naperville, IL 60564 US
(630)917-1288
press.photonetwork@gmail.com
http://www.pressphotographynetwork.com

BILL TO

College of DuPage
College of DuPage

425 Fawell Blvd,

Glen Ellyn, lllinois 60137
USA

Photography Services

1.50

COD/MAC archive photo shoot: 'Curse of the Starving Class.’

10-20-18

Post Production
Post Production

Photographer: Corey R. Minkanic

1.50

BALANCE DUE

01 =30~ (321 630 P00/(
§5 PHOTOGRAPHER (T19- CURSE

& PPN

FRESS PHOTOGRAPHT NETWORK
A Vil Mot By

E-MAILED NOV 0 7 2018

VOUCHERH VoS4 787

INVOICE # 1884
DATE 10/24/2018
DUE DATE 11/23/2018
TERMS Net 30

125.00 187.50

125.00 187.50

$375.00

/l/a 7//8



Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1272903

Vendor Name: Press Photography Network
Invoice Number: 1888

Invoice Date: 10/29/18

PO Number:

Check Number: E0070288

Check Amount: $ 1,625.00

Check Date: 11/14/2018

Department ID: 12241

Reviewer Name:

Voucher Number: V0541881

Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: junokasm(@cod.edu

Sent: Thu Nov 08 10:34:14 CST 2018

To: junokasm(@cod.edu,invoicing(@cod.edu

oe:

Subject: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Device

Please open the attached document. It was scanned and sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction Device.
Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page Multifunction Printer Location: AR201WC7835 Device Name:
PRN303

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf]



¢ College of DuPage

Walcome Maily

11/09/18“*BETHANY CRUSE

Voucher Number V0541881
Voucher Amount $375.00
Vendor ID and/or Name 1272903 Press Photography Network

Voucher Status  In Progress {Unfinished) AP Type IM Invoices < $15,000

Voucher Date  11/08/18 Voucher Maintenance Date  11/08/18 Due Date  11/08/18
Involce Number 1888 Invoice Date  10/28/18

Check/Transaction Number Paid Date

Created from Document

Item Vendar Unit of Extended | nicoribution

Price
TERO L A E

Comments

Quantity Price

Approval Date Next Approval

myACCESS



Press Photography Network

28W436 Juanita Dr

Naperville, IL 60564 US

(630)917-1288
press.photonetwork@gmail.com
http://www.pressphotographynetwork.com

BILL TO

College of DuPage
College of DuPage

425 Fawell Blvd,

Glen Ellyn, lllinois 60137
USA

Photography Services 1.50
COD/MAC: Sunday, Oct. 28 — DuPage Community Jazz
Ensemble & Dance lessons

Post 1.50
Post Production

Photographer: Corey R. Minkanic BALANCE DUE

01 - 30— JAa4/ - 630700/

@ PPN

VHESS PHOTOGRAPHT NETWORK
A ¥ieal Mol Bondneny

VOUCHER#H V@ 5H{38(

INVOICE # 1888
DATE 10/29/2018
DUE DATE 11/28/2018
TERMS Net 30

125.00 187.50

125.00 187.50

$375.00
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