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(O College of DuPage 
• '1' • 

AGREEMENT ~~767-
NUMBER: 

* Independent Contractor-· -
Agreement 
(Not to be used for contracts in excess of $5,000.00} Pm ~lfll\ APPROVED-Supervisor, Purchasing . . ' DATE 

I I 

PART I. Complete PRIOR to performance of contractual services. 

St 
Ci._ _____________ ....,... ______________________ _ 

Agrees to perform on _Qc,l_, 17 ~c,,\ ~ f _1 ~ D LJ_(_J_ - ~1.f:m_ the following services for the College of DuPage: 

<:ws-r \e&-Jii(eV -Pov wW)'JcC~t,iV\ tl!21Jv¥---: .. -.:.--
--------------------------------------•-----.-.... 

•••• • • •• • • • • • • ------------------- ---------------.----·••·----
• • • • •••• 

If additional space is needed, please continue description of services on separate pages and attach to this form. • • • • : • : 

The sum of$ 2 [D , 01> will be paid to the independent contractor upon completion of the services. The cwl'tUeior w:1 beel'!lsponsible for ••• 
all taxes related to income from the above services. The contractor understands that he/she is self employed and mu~Uarry at;iis,tecown cost : : 
any insurance coverage such as workers compensation, medical, property & liability including auto related to the ab)_v~.nJentiontltl services. 

This is a "work for hire" agreement. All rights to materials produced or products from services rendered are propertyg(:9olleg~of D1,1Page in 
perpetuity. • : • • • • • 

The contractor agrees to hold College of DuPage, its Trustees, officers, directors, agents, successors and assigns, harmless-fr®'~g!T against all 

~~:::::::·~:~r~e;~:~:=~ed::~:::· 
8

a:: ::~:nses, includ4§ing atto~n~s;fees~which ;~ •:s~ dur~g pertonn;fince 1/Jof th: ;rOement 

determined that the individual on this agreement __ J,A,lU:'.,1".\S _ _ ::_\~ ✓ IV _L7 _j L 
meets the definition of an independent contractor. EPA TM 

0

NT AUTHORIZED SI NATOR -'JOA-TE ___ _ 

All independent contractors must also certify below regarding the status of any educational loans as required by state law effective January 1, 1988. 
{Must Check One) 

D I certify that I am not in default on an educational loan guaranteed by the State in the amount of $600.00 or more. 

~ I certify that I am in default on an educational loan guaranteed by the State in the amount of $600.00 or more and I agree to 
make arrangements for repayment of this loan with the maker or guarantor within six months from the date of this contract. 

a copy of the contractual agreement. 

____ _,_J~b/_1,}_1_g __ _ 
DATE 

PART II. Complete AFTER performance of contractual services. 
' ·•- .•·- ···· -- ------ -- ---------- ---- -- ------- -- - --·-·-- "•'" ------------- ···-·· .. ---- · ···-- ·-•--··· - --

• • 
••••• • • ••• 

Authorized Signator certifies that the contractual services described in Part I above were completed satisfactorily and authorizes payment in full. 

(Pay_. ~:o_~~-~~tion of ~~!i\t service._)_·--------- ----~--~-

COLLEGE AUTHO SIGNATURE ~/~ATE /.:_I COUNTER SIGNATOR OPTIONAL DATE 

•see board policy, procedures and instructions on reverse side. 
(This agreement is VOID if amount exceeds $5,000.00} 

Original forward to Accounts Payable; Blue, Purchasing Dept,; Yellow, Signator; Pink, Contractor 
C/0 1592 (Rev. 9/14) 



Zerrudo, Maria 

F_rom: Mosher, Jill 
Sent: 
To: 

Friday, November 2, 2018 11 :25 AM 
Zerrudo, Maria 

Subject: FW: Sandra Woltman IC Agreement 

IC Agreement for Sandra Woltman - Maren wants to use GL 05-60-00661-5503001 

From: McKellin, Maren K. 
Sent: Friday, November 2, 2018 10:21 AM 
To: Mosher, Jill <mosher@cod.edu> 
Subject: RE: Sandra Woltman IC Agreement 

Thanks, Jill. 

From: Mosher, Jill 
Sent: Friday, November 2, 2018 9:58 AM 
To: McKellin, Maren K.<mckellin@cod.edu> 
Subject: RE: Sandra Woltman IC Agreement 

Yes, we can use that GL number. 

From: McKellin, Maren K. 
Sent: Friday, November 2, 2018 8:55 AM 
To: Mosher, Jill <mosher@cod.edu> 
Subject: RE: Sandra Woltman IC Agreement 

OK. Can you please use 0S-60-00661-5503001? 

Thanks, 
Maren' 

From: Mosher, Jill 
Sent: Thursday, November 1, 2018 9:50 AM 
To: McKellin, Maren K. <mckellin@cod.edu> 
Subject: Sandra Woltman IC Agreement 

Maren, I'm creating a voucher for Sandra and the GL account number on the contract does not exist. See screen shot. 
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GL Account 05_:60_00661_5309002 does not exist 

OK 
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