
 Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1084432
Vendor Name: Enterprise Rent-A-Car - Glen E
Invoice Number: 18550450
Invoice Date: 09/12/18
PO Number: 
Check Number: 0244498
Check Amount: $ 333.04
Check Date: 11/14/2018
Department ID: 12036
Reviewer Name: None
Voucher Number: V0528824
Redaction Type: None
Document Type: AP Invoice
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From: smithb244@cod.edu 
Sent: Wed Oct 24 15:55:05 CDT 2018 
To: invoicing@cod.edu 
CC: 
Subject: FW: Enterprise Rent-A-Car 

Attached is invoice l8550450 for Enterprise Rent-A-Car. Beverly Smith Administrative Assistant Athletics 
and Recreational Programs College of DuPage Email: smithb244@cod.edu (630)942-4242 -----Original 
Message----- From: smithb244@cod.edu Sent: Wednesday, October 24, 2018 3:51 PM To: Smith, Beverly 
Subject: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Device Please open the attached document. It was scanned and 
sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction Device. Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page Multifunction Printer 
Location: Device Name: Printer-095 

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf] 
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EAN SERVICES. LlC 
' PO BOX 402383 I ATLANTA. GA 30384-2383 

· For Billing Inquiries 
I 8775305141 
l ARADMIN@EHI.COM 

• FArl T:,l( lrl 4 307?4835 

ENTcRFP.IFcHOLDING5 

I 
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{COLLEGE OF DUPAGE-DIRECT BILL 
1 Rental Summary 

C ... lidated lnv.tt: 18550450 
CJl9illlidated lnv.l:Jate· 12-Sep-2018 

~ 
, Ext Bill Ref# 1 : Pickup Date l\c ~ 

RA # Ext Bill Ref# 2 '. Pickup Location ~., 
; Renter Name : Ext Bill Ref# 3 ; Return Date C rg'li,- Total Charges 

: CARD/OTTO Ext Bill Ref# 4 , Return Location '91' 

Amount in . 
USD'. 

~-·-----·--·----·- --·--·~--.••. ' Ext Bill .Ref# 5 _____________ : CaJ <;l~ss _ ......... - --·--- -·----··· .. -------···--·-·--- -· .......____.. ................ ·-·-· • __ ·-· _ -- ------~----· 
i Enterprise Rent-A-Cat ... , 
i- __ ____ .. ___ • -·- ·--·-·-•·-·--- -·---- ---- -·•--··--·-··--·•·--'>•- ·--·----------··• ..... ----··· ........ ····-·-- ·-·--·-··----- - ··--··- ►--" ·------------·-----·-·-·-·-----·--~ 
! Contract ID I Account Number 15A9831 {COLLEGE OF DUPAGE-D!RECT Bill ____ ,._ : 
; Billing Number 15101727 {COLLEGE OF DUPAGE-DIRECT BILL - ····--·----·---·- .. - --· ----- - -WW ·--- ·-- ........ ·-····---····---··----··--···-·•-·· ; 
!-----·--·-·- ·---- - --·----····-·------·· -·~ ·---- ... - ---·-------------··-··"·· .. •-·•--· ·-.. ------· • -.... ----·-- - ,----·-····---·-.. --.--. 
: 3GF2KY i 15101727 l 09/11/201809:02 !1DAY@63.50 - 63.50 

] HYATT, JASON i GLEN ELLYN, IL i TOLL PASS WAIVER - W 7.99 • 

;- /. 09/1 21201807:01 trax, Surcharge and F ~ W 5.19 

) GLEN ELLYN. IL : .... ~ 

\1s~;~-;·{~~·~~iGE .. ~~·~~-~A~E~i;E·~~-~;LL .. Billing Nu~;;1i1~~~?-----·-·---- --..-----·-.. ·- --·--1!?.tal :c:;;~-;; ·r~~ --~~ -+-,USD 
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! Enterprise Rent A Car Grand Total For Account Number{COLLEGE OF DUPAGE•DIRECT BILL in USD - lllllllt _ __ 76.68: ·--·--- __ .. _______________ ··-·-----··----·------···· .. ---.-·--- . --· --··--- - . . - ··-·-···---·-· .. ----.. ---··---··--··--·-- - '"C""""- ... - ___________ _ ... ,. -·- ···--····· 
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 Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1084432
Vendor Name: Enterprise Rent-A-Car - Glen E
Invoice Number: 18878722
Invoice Date: 10/10/18
PO Number: 
Check Number: 0244498
Check Amount: $ 333.04
Check Date: 11/14/2018
Department ID: 12040
Reviewer Name: None
Voucher Number: V0537111
Redaction Type: None
Document Type: AP Invoice
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From: purchasingstudentworker@cod.edu 
Sent: Fri Oct 19 10:26:10 CDT 2018 
To: invoicing@cod.edu 
CC: 
Subject: FW: Scanned from a Xerox Multifuncti.on Device 

-----Original Message----- From: PRN157@cod.edu [mai1to:PRN157@cod.edu] Sent: Friday, October 19, 
2018 10:23 AM To: Purchasing - Student Worker Subject: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Device Please 
open the attached document It was scanned and sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction Device. Attachment 
File Type: pdf, Multi-Page Multifunction Printer Location: Bll540WC7835 Device Name: PRN157 

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf] 



EAN SERVICES, LLC {COLLEGE OF DUPAGE-DIRECT BILL 
PO BOX 402383 Rental Summary 
ATLANTA, GA 30384-2383 

ENTERPRISErOLDINGS. 

For Billing Inquiries 
8775306141 W·!i;lu!•M lttH9,·l,dr-J &:dJffiil 
ARADM IN@EHI.COM 

Fed Tax Id : 430724835 
Ext BilRef # 1 Pickup Date 

RA# Ext Bill Ref # 2 Pickup Location 
Renter Name Ext Bill Ref# 3 Return Date 
CARD/OTTO Ext Bill Ref# 4 Return Location 

Ext Bill Ref # 5 Car Class 
Enterprise Rent-A-Car 

Contract ID/ Account Number 15A9831 {COLLEGE OF DUPAGE-DIRECT BILL 

Billing Number 15101727 {COLLEGE OF DUPAGE-DIRECT BILL 
3MTVGQ 09/29/2018 09:49 

CONNELL, JOHN GLEN ELLYN, IL 

09/30/2018 09:18 

GLEN ELLYN, IL 

FVAR 

I 

I 3MV01W 09/29/2018 09:55 I FROEHLE, BARRY GLEN ELLYN, IL 

09/30/2018 09: 19 
i GLEN ELLYN, IL 

I FVAR 
! 

15A9831 {COLLEGE OF DUPAGE-DIRECT BILL - Billing Number 15101727 
I 

i 
Enterprise Rent A Car Grand Total For Account Number {COLLEGE OF DU PAGE-DIRECT BILL in USO 

~

; . 
. 

nqn?qn?n ~nn~n r ~n~ nn n~ u u , u 

Page 1 of 1 

11111111 111111111111 

Consolidated Inv. #: 18878722 

Consolidated Inv. Date: 1 0-Oct-2018 

Total Charges l Charges 
l 

I I 
---

1 DAY @97.00 97.001 
t 

PAI/PEC 12.001 

ROADSIDE ASSISTANCE 3.991 

TOLL PASS WAIVER 7.99 

Tax, Surcharge and Fee 7.20 

Total USO 128.18 

1 DAY @97.00 97.001 
PAI/PEC 12.00 

ROADSIDE ASSISTANCE 3.99 

TOLL PASS WAIVER 7.99 
Tax, Surcharge and Fee 7.20 

Total USO 128.181 

!<,rand Total in USD 

Amount in, 
usD; 

128.18 

128.18 
i 

256.36 

256.36 



EAN SERVICES, LLC 
{COLLEGE OF DUPAGE-DIRECT BILL 

PO BOX 402383 
Rental Summary 

I 
ATLANTA, GA 30384-2383 ENTERPRISEHOLDINGS. 

I 
W•it;h,l·M M i9P·HH=I Mh#lt#fl 

For Billing Inquiries Consolidated Inv. #: 18878722 
8775306141 
ARADMIN@EHI. COM Consolidated Inv. Date: 1 0-Oct-2018 

>00034 0907907 □ ROD~,_.- -~-~-~--•-.,--~ -,_.. ______________________ ...._ 

{COLLEGE OF DUPAGE- ~IRECT BILL 

~TJ~1Jt~~~l~¥'NI 111• P ll () \Tl~ I) 
GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137 
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~---------~-- -----···------7 --~~---.. ----~----
EAN SERVICES, LLC 
PO BOX 402383 
ATLANTA, GA 30384-2383 ENTEAPAISEHOLDINGS. 

For Billing Inquiries --=""-"'-• I 
8775306141 1 Ei·;i11t•M @Hir l:RA U,'!ff;ffltHI 
ARADMIN@EHI.COM 

Rental Summary 

(all amounts in USO) 

Enterprise Rent-A-Car Total 256.36 1 

Grand Total Amount Due 256.36 I 
I 

For billing inquiries, please contact us at 8775306141 or ARADMIN@EHI.COM. 

Payments are due within 30 days from the consolidated invoice date. Please mail payments in USD to : 

EAN SERVICES, LLC 
PO BOX 402383 
ATLANTA, GA - 30384-2383 

{COLLEGE OF DUPAGE-DIRECT BILL 

Consolidated Inv. #: 18878722 

Consolidated Inv. Date: 1 O-Oct-2018 

If you prefer to wire your payments to us, our bank details are as follows: Please email remittance detail to ARADMIN@EHI.COM: 

Bank Name : BANK OF AMERICA 
Overnight Address : 6000 FELDWOOD ROAD 

Account#: 

Routing Number : 

Name on Account : 

SWIFT Number : 

~ < . 

ATTN: LOCKBOX 402383 
COLLEGE PARK, GA 30384-2383 
us 
3752101429 

0260-0959-3 

EAN SERVICES, LLC 

BOFAUS3N 

nqn?qn?n ~nn~n r~n~ nnn~u ~,u II I I I 11 111111 1111111 



EAN SERVICES, LLC 
PO BOX 402383 
ATLANTA, GA 30384-2383 

For Billing Inquiries 
8775306141 
ARADMIN@EHI. COM 

I __ Account_# .. Billing Number 

························································ 
15A9831 15101727 

15A9831 15101727 

Total in USD 

{COLLEGE OF DUPAGE-DIRECT BILL 

ENTERPRISE~OLOINGS 
Rental Summary 

I 
■·S6ini-M Fi91·11H9 61:MMM 

Consolidated Inv. #: 18878722 
Consolidated Inv. Date: 1 0-Oct-2018 

Please Return This Page With Payments in USO 

Bill Ref# Rental Agreement# Amount Due Amount Paid 
O o O OOOO O ooOoO o o ooO>OOooOO >OOO OOOO O > o O o OoU ....................................................... ································ ......... , ... , ........................ 
500029797631 3MTVGQ 128.18 

500029798436 3MV01W 128.18 

256.36 
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