
 Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1083542
Vendor Name: Carol Fox & Associates
Invoice Number: 1029364
Invoice Date: 10/03/18
PO Number: B0359376
Check Number: E0069776
Check Amount: $ 8,335.00
Check Date: 10/17/2018
Department ID: 11601
Reviewer Name: 
Voucher Number: V0534054
Redaction Type: None
Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: junokasm@cod.edu 
Sent: Thu Oct 11 11:43:35 CDT 2018 
To: junokasm@cod.edu,invoicing@cod.edu 
CC: 
Subject: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Devi.Ce 

Please open the attached document. It was scanned and sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction Device. 
Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page Multifunction Printer Location: AR201 WC7835 Device Name: 
PRN303 

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf] 



• • Invo1ce 
/ invoice # 102936i] 

date 10/3/2018 

E-MAIL ED OCT 1 1 2018 terms Last Day Month 

duedate 10/31/2018 

description 

FY 18-19 

bill to: 
r 
College of DuPage 
Community College District No. 502 
425 Fawell Blvd. 
Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599 

College Digital Communications Fee (4 of 4) £o#3593/4 
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thank you! 

please make checks payable to: questions? contact Angie Abraham: 
Carol Fox and Associates phone: (773) 327-3830 x11 0 

fax: (773) 327-3834 
carol fox and associates, inc 
1412 w belmont ave 
chicago, ii 60657 

email:angiea@carolfoxassociates.com 

total 

payments/credits 

balance due 

' 

amount 

2,500.00 

$2,500.00 

$0.00 



 Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1083542
Vendor Name: Carol Fox & Associates
Invoice Number: 1029367
Invoice Date: 10/03/18
PO Number: B0359376
Check Number: E0069776
Check Amount: $ 8,335.00
Check Date: 10/17/2018
Department ID: 12301
Reviewer Name: 
Voucher Number: V0534056
Redaction Type: None
Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: junokasm@cod.edu 
Sent: Thu Oct 11 11:43:50 CDT 2018 
To: junokasm@cod.edu,invoicing@cod.edu 
CC: 
Subject: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Devi.Ce 

Please open the attached document. It was scanned and sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction Device. 
Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page Multifunction Printer Location: AR201 WC7835 Device Name: 
PRN303 

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf] 



} invoice# 

date 

invoice 
10293677 

10/3/2018 

E-MAILED OCT 112018 
terms Last Day Month 

due date 10/31/2018 

bill to: 
,r 

College of DuPage 
Community College District No. 502 
425 Fawell Blvd. 
Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599 

'-

description 

FY 18-1 9 

October 2018 Cleve Carney 
10.25.18-11.17.18 Print Portfolio Exhibition 8ott3SC/376 
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thank you! 

please make checks payable to: questions? contact Angie Abraham: 
Carol Fox and Associates phone: (773) 327-3830 x110 

fax: (773) 327-3834 
carol fox and associates, inc 
1412 w belmont ave 
chicago, ii 60657 

email:angiea@carolfoxassociates.com 

total 

payments/credits 

balance due 

amount 

1,500.00 

$1 ,500.00 

$0.00 



 Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1083542
Vendor Name: Carol Fox & Associates
Invoice Number: 1029366
Invoice Date: 10/03/18
PO Number: B0359376
Check Number: E0069776
Check Amount: $ 8,335.00
Check Date: 10/17/2018
Department ID: 11001
Reviewer Name: 
Voucher Number: V0534057
Redaction Type: None
Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: junokasm@cod.edu 
Sent: Thu Oct 11 11:43:47 CDT 2018 
To: junokasm@cod.edu,invoicing@cod.edu 
CC: 
Subject: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Devi.Ce 

Please open the attached document. It was scanned and sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction Device. 
Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page Multifunction Printer Location: AR201 WC7835 Device Name: 
PRN303 

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf] 



• • 1nvo1ce 
[mvoice# 1029366 / 

date 10/3/2018 

E-MAILED OCT 1 12018 terms Last Day Month 

due date 10/31/2018 

FY 18-19 

October 2018 College Shows 
10.04.18 Curse of the Star 
10.28.18 Jazz Ensemble 

description 

bill to: 
r 
College of DuPage 
Community College District No. 502 
425 Fawell Blvd. 
Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599 
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thank you! 

please make checks payable to: questions? contact Angie Abraham: 
Carol Fox and Associates phone: (773) 327-3830 x110 

fax: (773) 327-3834 
carol fox and associates, inc 
1412 w belmont ave 
chicago, ii 60657 

email:angiea@carolfoxassociates.com 

10/11/tt 

total 

payments/credits 

balance due 

' 

amount 

1,000.00 
1,000.00 

$2,000.00 

$0.00 



 Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1083542
Vendor Name: Carol Fox & Associates
Invoice Number: 1029363
Invoice Date: 10/03/18
PO Number: B0359376
Check Number: E0069776
Check Amount: $ 8,335.00
Check Date: 10/17/2018
Department ID: 11601
Reviewer Name: 
Voucher Number: V0534058
Redaction Type: None
Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: junokasm@cod.edu 
Sent: Thu Oct 11 11:43:29 CDT 2018 
To: junokasm@cod.edu,invoicing@cod.edu 
CC: 
Subject: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Devi.Ce 

Please open the attached document. It was scanned and sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction Device. 
Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page Multifunction Printer Location: AR201 WC7835 Device Name: 
PRN303 

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf] 



• • 1nvo1ce 
[invoice# 10293637 

date 10/3/2018 

E-MAILED OCT 1 12018 
terms Last Day Month 

due date 10/31/2018 

description 

FY 18-19 

October 2018 General Supply Fee 

bill to: 
r 
College of DuPage 
Community College District No. 502 
425 Fawell Blvd. 
Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599 

BD#-359310 
•UN£ I == t;75,oo 

OS- 60 -//6()/-5'/0 TOO/ 

llP \TJ~llJl1J ~ 

1()/11/111 - tl1llll1I Zl~llll(JI)( 

os- 60 - llbOf- S'<f-o?OOf ~ t11s.oo 
15 fUBL/C REU1nONS SE/JC/ 

/0/11/tl 

thank you! 

please make checks payable to: questions? contact Angie Abraham: 
Carol Fox and Associates phone: (773) 327-3830 x110 

fax: (773) 327-3834 
carol fox and associates, inc 
1412 w belmont ave 
chicago, ii 60657 

email:angiea@carolfoxassociates.com 

total 

payments/credits 

balance due 

amount 

175.00 

$175.00 

$0.00 



 Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1083542
Vendor Name: Carol Fox & Associates
Invoice Number: 1029362
Invoice Date: 10/03/18
PO Number: B0359376
Check Number: E0069776
Check Amount: $ 8,335.00
Check Date: 10/17/2018
Department ID: 11601
Reviewer Name: 
Voucher Number: V0534060
Redaction Type: None
Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: junokasm@cod.edu 
Sent: Thu Oct 11 11:43:22 CDT 2018 
To: junokasm@cod.edu,invoicing@cod.edu 
CC: 
Subject: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Devi.Ce 

Please open the attached document. It was scanned and sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction Device. 
Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page Multifunction Printer Location: AR201 WC7835 Device Name: 
PRN303 

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf] 



• • 1nvo1ce 
l invoice # 1029362 J 

date 10/3/2018 

E-MAILED OCT 1 1 20\8 terms Last Day Month 

due date 10/31/2018 

bill to: 

College of DuPage 
Community College District No. 502 
425 Fawell Blvd. 
Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599 

description 

FY 18-19 

October 2018 Website Maintenance Fee Bc#35?370 
i l/NE I :; i 1500.00 
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thank you! 

please make checks payable to: questions? contact Angie Abraham: 
Carol Fox and Associates phone: (773) 327-3830 x110 

fax: (773) 327-3834 
carol fox and associates, inc 
1412 w belmont ave 
chicago, ii 60657 

email:angiea@carolfoxassociates.com 

total 

payments/credits 

balance due 

amount 

1,500.00 

$1,500.00 

$0.00 



 Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1083542
Vendor Name: Carol Fox & Associates
Invoice Number: 1029361
Invoice Date: 10/03/18
PO Number: B0359376
Check Number: E0069776
Check Amount: $ 8,335.00
Check Date: 10/17/2018
Department ID: 11601
Reviewer Name: 
Voucher Number: V0534107
Redaction Type: None
Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: junokasm@cod.edu 
Sent: Thu Oct 11 11:43:09 CDT 2018 
To: junokasm@cod.edu,invoicing@cod.edu 
CC: 
Subject: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Devi.Ce 

Please open the attached document. It was scanned and sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction Device. 
Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page Multifunction Printer Location: AR201 WC7835 Device Name: 
PRN303 

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf] 



[mvoice# 

date 

invoice 
1029361 J 
10/3/2018 

E-MAILED OCT 1 i 2018 terms Last Day Month 

due date 10/31/2018 

llP \TJ~ll 

FY 18-1 9 

September 2018 Event Promotion Graphic Design 
16.5 Hours of Graphic Design Time @ $40/hour 

05-~0-//60/-5t/07()0( =- .fb(Jt).00 

bill to: 

College of DuPage 
Community College District No. 502 

80#3573 
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thank you! total 

please make checks payable to: questions? contact Angie Abraham: 
Carol Fox and Associates phone: (773) 327-3830 x110 

fax: {773) 327-3834 payments/credits 
carol fox and associates, inc 
1412 w belmont ave email:angiea@carolfoxassociates.com 
chicago, ii 60657 balance due 

amount 

660.00 

$660.00 

$0.00 

$660.00 
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