
 Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1087327
Vendor Name: The Morton Arboretum
Invoice Number: 8/1-8/31 ISBE COOP
Invoice Date: 10/15/18
PO Number: P0360741
Check Number: 0241676
Check Amount: $ 758.88
Check Date: 10/17/2018
Department ID: 04700
Reviewer Name: 
Voucher Number: V0534535
Redaction Type: FERPA
Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved
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Collcc e of OuPace and the 
lllnoiis aoard of Hither Eduation 

Cooper.a Uva Work Studv Proi•ct 
Jlk!y l, 2018•AUlll~t 31, 2019 R~imbursl!!ITM!nt Form 

PO:360741 

l. Pl,,a,e c~• lh• lnformatlon'below. U,o • up•t•I~ .sheet for ••ch shldrnt. 

~:=\~~t.kb~[:;~-'.\ :_, .. :<'". . -.; :·. . : . -·. 
4.'. Attacli • ,<Of!V,'!ll'l?"';w,~...,,:~·~ ~s• Y'?°'·'~lm~r~•ntpav1111nt IOolv ne•d,d far f~<t r~Por1ini cvd•) 
DUet~thof~~.!hu'.-~;:,.~.:.~~;~··~;~; ... -/· ~.~~·:..~" ....... ~~ .• ~ . L , '.;> •. .._., ., 

Comp•nv Name: The Morton Arboretum 

Contact Name and TIiie at Company: Kim She.ircr, Trre: and Shrub Breeder 

J.\11 \TJ~llll~Il~I) 
I () / I (i/ 111 - llf)lll~ll'f )l1-llll~I{ 

Contact Nam• SIJn.itun, 

Contact Phone Number: 
-·~.-~~····" --------- ----- -----

630.719.4885 

Contact email: 

1cmino1r attendance 

Servlce •<llvltles 9flered lo student:. 
(l'lifn~ note thl• mlm to an~I.IOJUnlfft' ~t1nUl1u ,.iw.J~ 10 ,n. .saWC'flt JI.tooth YOtH lOfJJPJJl1, 

Did Sll><f•nt obuln .,.,manont ornployment In t111no;.1 __ Yes No 

tf yos, ple;;ut! provid" d~tft of empl,oyrnent :iind n.1me of employM. 

Period of Ptrformancc 

7 11 l;Ql3 7«~l!JQIR 

8/l/201B·B/31/2D18 

9/1/2018-9/30/2018 

10/l/2018-10/31/2018 

ll/l/2018·11/30/2018 

12/l/2018·12/31/20l8 

TOTAL 

Hours worked: ______ Hourly Rate: 

~ 

ReimQursement wiil be made upon receipt of thts form. Direct any quution.s about reimbursement lo Krystlni LaSon,a 
630·942-2230, lasornk@cod.edu 

Pleil-Se fmo1II this form and ;1Hachm1mts to: 

College o/ DuPa,:e 
Ciillreer Ser"VfC~S - IBHE 

lasor5ak@cod.edu 
425 hwoll Blvd 
Gl,n Ekyn, IL 60137 

Thilnk -you acain for pi1nldp;nin1 in thlS v,fuabte experience for the students. 

______ Tot~ Waccs/Monlhly 

512.00 
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College of DuPag~ 
Student Affairs and Institutional Advancement 

IBHE FY19 Work Study Grant Reimbursement Process 

Earl E . Dowling 
Vice President 

425 Fawell Blvd. 

G len Ellyn, Illinois 60137-6599 

(630) 942-3416 phone 

(630) 790-2686 /ro­
dow)jpge@?rod edu 

cod.edu 

I write t his letter t o ou tline the r eimbur sement p rocess that 
will occur for t he IBHE FY19 Work Study grant that the College 
received for the 2018 - 2019 academic year . This grant is 
administered by the Career Services Center staff and Krystina 
Lasorsa , Assistant Manager of career services serves as the 
grant project manager . 

The I BHE grant supports local employers who hi r e interns from 
the College of DuPage by reimburs ing t hem for half the wages 
they pay a student for the experience . For this p r ocess to 
happen smoothly, the followi ng will take place : 

1 . All invoices f r om participating employers will be submitted 
monthly, thus we will issue a reimbursement for ha lf t he wages 
they have already paid. This will appear as an "after the fact " 
purc hase i n our accounting system . 

2 . Invoices will be submitted to pu rchasing any time f r om the 
date of this letter through Augus t 31, 2019 . Please note the 
reimbursemen ts may be for internships t aking p l ace a nytime 
during the grant cycl e (July 1 2018- August 31 , 2019 . 

3 . The i nvoices s hall be paid through the IBHEFY19 grant 
account - 06-10-04700. 

Student Affairs 



From: lasorsak@cod.edu 
Sent: Fri Oct 12 17:00:01 CDT 2018 
To: invoicing@cod.edu 
CC: zehjudy@cod.edu 
Subject: FY19 IBHE 

Hi, 

Please see attached for the following employers: 
RCOP 
Shamrock Florist 
Cantigny Park 
Inside Look (august and sept) 
Morton Arboretum 

Thanks! 

Krystina Lasorsa 
Assistant Manager-Career Services 
College of DuPage 
630-942-2230 
She/Her/Hers 



From: marekr@cod.edu 
Sent: Mon Oct 15 10:16:51 CDT 2018 
To: invoicing@cod.edu 
CC: 
Subject: 

Bobby Marek 
Accounts Payable Team Leader 

Cash Disbursements/Payroll Department 

College of DuPage 
425 Fawell Blvd I SRC 21321 Glen Ellyn, IL60137-6599 

phone 630-942-2229 I marekr@cod.edu 
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