
 Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1185893
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From: marekr@cod.edu 
Sent: Fri Aug 17 07:53:15 CDT 2018 
To: invoicing@cod.edu 
CC: 
Subject: FW: Ron Clesens Ornamental Plants Request 

Bobby Marek 
Accounts Payable Team Leader 

Cash Disbursements/ Payroll Department 

College of DuPage 
425 Fawell Blvd I SRC 21321 Glen Ellyn, IL60137-6599 

phone 630-942-2229 I marekr@cod.edu 

From: Lasorsa, Krystina 
Sent: Thursday, August 16, 2018 4:16 PM 
To: Marek, Robert <marekr@cod.edu > 
Subject: RE: Ron Clesens Ornamental Plants Request 

Hi Bobby, 

That font is horrible! The font makes it look like an 8 but t he 8 was actually a 6. 

Please see attached. 

Sorry! 

Krystina 

From: Marek, Robert 
Sent: Thursday, August 16, 2018 3:46 PM 
To: Lasorsa, Krystina <lasorsak@cod.edu> 
Subject: Ron Clesens Ornamental Plants Request 

Hi Krystina, 

For the attached payment request, the PO number listed, 359893, does not exist. I checked the vendor card to see if there was 
another PO or pending requisition, but I couldn't find anything. Do you know if something has been submitted to Purchasing 
for this item yet? 

Thank you, 

Bobby Marek 
Accounts Payable Team Leader 

Cash Disbursements/Payroll Department 

College of DuPage 
425 Fawell Blvd I SRC 21321 Glen Ellyn, IL60137-6599 

phone 630-942-2229 I marekr@cod.edu 
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