
 Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1082020
Vendor Name: Automation Direct
Invoice Number: 9014875
Invoice Date: 07/27/18
PO Number: 
Check Number: E0068856
Check Amount: $ 255.20
Check Date: 08/22/2018
Department ID: 00073
Reviewer Name: Bridget McFarland
Voucher Number: V0521811
Redaction Type: None
Document Type: AP Invoice
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COLLEGE OF DUPAGE 
ATTN ACCOUNTS PAYABLE DEPT. 
425 FAWELL BLVD 
GLEN ELLYN IL 60137-6599 

. . _Order Date. _ Order.No 

7/2712018 

Item ID Item Descrip on 

Delivery Ins uctlons: 
Ca ier: 

AR22PR-210BZA Fuji Electric sel ctor switch, 

• • • 

• • • • • • • • • 

SHIP TO: 

INVOICE 
Invoice Customer ID: 
9014875 1047261 

Invoice Date Page 
07/27/2018 1 of 1 

Mail Payments To: 

AUTQMATIONDIRECT.COM, INC. 
P.O. BOX 402417 

ATLANTA, GA 30384-2417 
www.automationdlrect.com 

Pay online at: 
http://www.automationdirect.com 

COLLEGE OF DUPAGE 
425 FAWELL BLVD 
GLEN ELLYN. IL 60137-6708 

PO Number 

Pricing 
UOM 

EA 

Unit 
Price 

8,9 

Extended 
Price 

178.60 
2-position. mainitMl'l'e'l!~,,.t!e~------------------------­
contact(s), plastic base, metal 

E22NS42 

bezel, Operator: black, knob, 30mm, 
round, plastic. 

Eaton legend plate, aluminum, black 
field, silver background, black 
engraved text, legend plate marking 
"OFF ON". For use with 22mm pilot 
devices. 

Total Lines: 2 

Due Date: 8126/2018 

20.0000 

Terms: Net 30 

Toll Free: 800-633-0405 
AIR Direct: 770-889-7588 
AIR Fax: 770-781"0564 

Form W9: https://cdn.automationdirect.comlstatiC/acJc_w9.pdf 

Email: ar@automaliondirect.com 

0001:0001 

EA 3.83 

SUB-TOTAL: 

76.60 

255.20 
0.00 

255.201 

111 

US Tax ID: 58-204197 1 
Canada GSTIHST#: 853680387RT0001 



From: mcfarl@cod.edu 
Sent: Mon Jul 30 12:34:38 CDT 2018 
To: invoicing@cod.edu 
CC: 
Subject: FW: Voucher Confirmation: V052 l 811 

Automation Direct ok to pay. Voucher Confirmation: V0S21811 

Bridget McFarland 
Business and Technology Division I Program Support Specialist 
College of DuPage 

425 Fawell Blvd. I Glen Ellyn, IL60137-6599 

phone 630.942.8419 I mcfarl@cod.edu 

From: Clark, Robert 

Sent: Friday, Ju ly 27, 2018 11:41 AM 
To: McFarland, Bridget <mcfarl@cod.edu> 

Subject: Fw: Voucher Confirmation: V0521811 

Automation Direct ok to pay. 

Bob 

Bob Clark Ed.D. CTE 
Business and Technology I HVACR Coordinator 
College of DuPage 

425 Fawell Blvd. I Glen Ellyn, IL60137-6599 

Phone: 630.942.3068 ITEC 10571 clarkr307@cod.edu 

" ... if we teach today as we taught yesterday, we rob our children of tomorrow ... "--John Dewey 

From: acctpay@cod.edu <acctpay@cod.edu > 

Sent: Friday, Ju ly 27, 2018 11:39 AM 

To: Clark, Robert 

Subject: Voucher Confirmation: V0521811 

Voucher Number V0521811 

Voucher Status In Progress (Unfinished) 

Requestor Name Mr RobertJ. Clark 

Voucher Date 07 /27 /18 

Due Date 07 /27 /20 

Vendor ID and/or Name 1082020 Automation Direct 

APType IM lnvoices<$15,000 



APType IM lnvoices<$15,000 

VoucherTotal $255.20 

ITEMl 

Item Description Fuji Electric selector switch, 22mm, 2-p 

Quantity 20.000 

Price $8.9300 

Extended Price $178.60 

GL Distribution 01-10-00073-5401002 

ITEM2 

Item Description Eaton legend plate, aluminum, blackfiel 

Quantity 20.000 

Price $3.8300 

Extended Price $76.60 

GLDistribution 01-10-00073-5401002 

COMMENTS 

This is for instructional supplies for the HVACR lab. 

APPROVAL DATE 

NEXT APPROVALS 
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Sbippla~ 01lUtili: 

Shi,pllg: mtthoo ii FREE l'Yt"O Day Delh-ery 
Sht)ltllft'JI$ ti;,.- ttijg: 01-dtr ~ t'CA l)~, 1ia1111.io1L 

C.ntactl11fo:-----------------

Anm1rla:~ 1t Cttrk 
Pl,oJJ,e l'-uul>f:r. 630·9•.U·JOGS 
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https://www.automationdirect.convjsp/checkout/printableSummary.jsp?ov .. 

ORDER#: 10250908 PO #: HVACLab 

Cuslomer #: 1047261 

July 27, 2018 12:32 Jlnl EOT 

Auton11UonDln:ct 
3505 HUlt"hbtson Road 
Cwnming. GA 30040 
Phone: (800) 633-0405 
F.1x: (770) 889-7876 

Dunt.pdon Pike Qwwd.'3' T.r:M (USS) 

COLLEGE OF DUPAGE OlLE~ OF DUPAGE 
•12.S FAWfl.L. BLVD 5 F'AWl1~L 01,VO 

SubTolal 
Shlpplng and Handling 

Total (I.JS S) 

ATTN ACCOUNTS PAYABLE DEPT. GLEN B.LYN. IL 601J7-~708 

BWTo:------------------ ~ hip Te· 

G1.£Na1.,.YN,U.60U7 s 
us 

S255,20 
S0.00 

$255-20 

_J 
SJllppingl.Allel N~•• :-----------------------------------~ 

ATIMIC»I : Robe11 Chi,: 

Thank you ror pul'cllas.111.g 1he above uems rrom Automauondlrect Fo1· quesllons or 001mnt-11u about thls orde-r, call w. at the addrtss, phone or tax number ~hown al Ille 1op of thb page. Ple-a1e refe-re11ce yom· cu~tomer 
::md/01· onle-r number h1 any correspondeocts. 

1.\)) J) )l f) \TJ~ I) 

()11/15/111 -

7/27/2018, II :40 AM 
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