Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1083542

Vendor Name: Carol Fox & Associates
Invoice Number: 1029234

Invoice Date: 08/03/18

PO Number: B0359376

Check Number: E0068724

Check Amount: $ 3,855.00

Check Date: 08/15/2018

Department ID: 11601

Reviewer Name:

Voucher Number: V0523129
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: junokasm(@cod.edu

Sent: Tue Aug 14 09:25:18 CDT 2018

To: junokasm(@cod.edu,invoicing(@cod.edu

oe:

Subject: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Device

Please open the attached document. It was scanned and sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction Device.
Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page Multifunction Printer Location: AR201WC7835 Device Name:
PRN303

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf]



CARIL oy £ ASSpCIATES
invoice

date  8/3/2018
terms  Last Day Month
due date  8/31/2018

E-MAILED AUG 1417018

bill to:

College of DuPage

Community College District No. 502
425 Fawell Blvd.

Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599

C description I amount )
ﬂ\

>
(FY 18-19

\\
August 2018 Website Maintenance Fee O# 35?. ')76 1,500.00

LNE [ = £/500.00 )

05 -60-1(60/-S40700/

AP VERIFIED
08/14/18 - MARIA ZERRUDO

0S40 - 1160/~ SH0T00( = $/500. 00
75 puBLIC RELRTIONS SE77

08)10/18

\ ~ I\ <
( thank you! y total $1,500.00
fplease make checks payable to: | questions? contact Angie Abraham:

Carol Fox and Associates hone: (773) 327-3830 x110 .

o (77(3) eyl payments/credits 0.00
carol fox and associates, inc [~
1412 w belmont ave email:angiea@carolfoxassociates.com

| chicago, il 60857 balance due

A

$1,500.00
J



Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1083542

Vendor Name: Carol Fox & Associates
Invoice Number: 1029233

Invoice Date: 08/03/18

PO Number: B0359376

Check Number: E0068724

Check Amount: $ 3,855.00

Check Date: 08/15/2018

Department ID: 12301

Reviewer Name:

Voucher Number: V0523130
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: junokasm(@cod.edu

Sent: Tue Aug 14 09:25:26 CDT 2018

To: junokasm(@cod.edu,invoicing(@cod.edu

oe:

Subject: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Device

Please open the attached document. It was scanned and sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction Device.
Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page Multifunction Printer Location: AR201WC7835 Device Name:
PRN303

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf]



CAROL Fox 3 HSSoClRTES

invoice

[invoice # 1029233 [

bill to:

date  8/3/2018

terms  Last Day Month
E-MAILED AUG 14201 o gae  omtr20t8

College of DuPage

Community College District No. 502
425 Fawell Blvd.

Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599

( description amount )
(5?1 8-18 f B
omcammsanten 50#535‘?37@
o/INS 3= $/500.00
01 -30~ /2301~ 540700/
i A
AP VERIMED
08/14/18 - MARIA ZERRUDO
0l - 30-13301~840700/
75 publie RELATIONS GI&-ANXIETY
081018
\ AN /
3 Y N\
( thank youl | total $1,500.00
please make checks _payable to: | questions? contact Angie Abraham:
Carol Fox and Associates ?ahxc::r}% g?)?é?g??%gé?;%o x110 payments/credits $0.00
carol fox and associates, inc . . =~
; :|1c: i ;\:} f:nislehggg; _?ve email:angiea@carolfoxassociates.com balance due @
AN v,



Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1083542

Vendor Name: Carol Fox & Associates
Invoice Number: 1029232

Invoice Date: 08/03/18

PO Number: B0359376

Check Number: E0068724

Check Amount: $ 3,855.00

Check Date: 08/15/2018

Department ID: 11601

Reviewer Name:

Voucher Number: V0523132
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: junokasm(@cod.edu

Sent: Tue Aug 14 09:25:34 CDT 2018

To: junokasm(@cod.edu,invoicing(@cod.edu

oe:

Subject: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Device

Please open the attached document. It was scanned and sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction Device.
Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page Multifunction Printer Location: AR201WC7835 Device Name:
PRN303

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf]



CHEDL Fox X ASSoclATES . _
iInvoice

) invoice # 1029232 ]
date  8/3/2018

terms  Last Day Month

E-MAILED AUG 14 2018 quedate 83122018
bill to:

College of DuPage

Community College District No. 502
425 Fawell Blvd.

Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599

description I amount )
B el
(FY 18-19 Y w

August 2018 General Supply Fee 8(}#:_55?3 76 175.00

e e | = $/78.00
05-do-lleol-S¥0T00/ )

AP VERIFIED
08/14/18 - MARIA ZERRUDO

0S- 60~ lleo(-S40T00/ = ®77500
75 PUBLIC RELATIONS SEAT

f/,( b %ZuX%M/M

08/10[18 It

> ; =
[ thank you! | total $175.00
please make checks _payable to: | questions? contact Angie Abraham:
Carol Fox and Associates ?ahxc:)rz% %‘;7332)?31%;33:‘830 x110 payments/credits $0.00
carol fox and associates, inc ) _ _
; ﬁl‘lc i ;\; f:ﬁlrgggé ?ve email.angiea@carolfoxassociates.com balance dus @
AN /

N~



Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1083542

Vendor Name: Carol Fox & Associates
Invoice Number: 1029258

Invoice Date: 08/03/18

PO Number: B0359376

Check Number: E0068724

Check Amount: $ 3,855.00

Check Date: 08/15/2018

Department ID: 11601

Reviewer Name:

Voucher Number: V0523136
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: junokasm(@cod.edu

Sent: Tue Aug 14 09:25:49 CDT 2018

To: junokasm(@cod.edu,invoicing(@cod.edu

oe:

Subject: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Device

Please open the attached document. It was scanned and sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction Device.
Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page Multifunction Printer Location: AR201WC7835 Device Name:
PRN303

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf]



CAROL FoK & ASSOCIAIES invoice

[invoice # 1029258 |

date  8/3/2018
terms  Last Day Month
due date  8/31/2018

E-MAILED AUG 14 2018

bill to:

College of DuPage

Community College District No. 502
425 Fawell Blvd.

Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599

( description I amount )
>
July 2018 Event Promotion Graphic Design h

o UNE ! = $360.00
05 -60- 601~ SY0 700!

oUNE 5 = $240.00 _
0l — 30— /RS--SO 700/

AP VERIFIE"
08/14/18 - MARIAZERRUDO

05- 40— 11601 - 540700/ = $360.00
0[- 30~ (15[ 540100/ /-——- $ 2dp.00
01-30-]333]- S40 7001 = £ 89.00

75 PUBLIC RELATIONS (see arfaChed for QR

Graphic Design Services

17 Hours at $40 per Hour 680.00

Jo - /433 -5¢0740/

" é’ AU \_%Wﬂ"—-)

09//0//8/\( A <

\,
( thank you! | total $680.00
please make checks payable to: | questions? contact Angie Abraham: )
Carol Fox and Associates ?;xc::rzt;:? 537)7332)7?%;‘-3?4830 x110 payments/credits $0.00
carol fox and associates, inc ) _
g ﬁ|1c i ;n:; bﬁelrgggé ?ve email:angiea@carolfoxassociates.com balance due @
AN >
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