
 Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1194810
Vendor Name: Roy Houff Co., Llc
Invoice Number: 102047047
Invoice Date: 05/14/18
PO Number: 
Check Number: 0238312
Check Amount: $ 466.04
Check Date: 08/21/2018
Department ID: 00077
Reviewer Name: Linda Hickman
Voucher Number: V0523389
Redaction Type: None
Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



From: marekr@cod.edu 
Sent: Thu Aug 16 15:14:11 CDT 2018 
To: invoicing@cod.edu 
CC: 
Subject: FW: Roy Houff invoice not paid # 10204 704 7 $107 .36 

Bobby Marek Accounts Payable Team Leader Cash Disbursements/Payroll Department College of DuPage 
425 Fawell Blvd l SRC 2132 l Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599 phone 630-942-2229 l marekr@cod.edu 
-----Original Message----- From: Hull, Amy Sent: Monday, August 13, 2018 2: 17 PM To: Marek, Robert 
Subject: Roy Houff invoice not paid #102047047 $107.36 -----Original Message----- From: Hull, Amy Sent: 
Friday, May 18, 2018 11:32 AM To: Hickman, Linda Subject: ok to pay Roy Houff Hi Linda, please process 
the attached invoice it is ok to pay. Thank you, Amy -----Original Message----- From: hullamy@cod.edu Sent: 
Friday, May 18, 2018 11 :25 AM To: Hull, Amy Subject: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer Please 
open the attached document. It was scanned and sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction Printer. Attachment 
File Type: pdf, Multi-Page Multifunction Printer Location: TEC Device Name: Printer-038 

[ attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer. pdf] 
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PLEASE REMIT TO: SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS 

Houff Com 6200 S. OAK PARK ~VE. 

CHICAGO, IL 60638 
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 Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1194810
Vendor Name: Roy Houff Co., Llc
Invoice Number: 102044658
Invoice Date: 05/07/18
PO Number: 
Check Number: 0238312
Check Amount: $ 466.04
Check Date: 08/21/2018
Department ID: 00077
Reviewer Name: Linda Hickman
Voucher Number: V0523390
Redaction Type: None
Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



PLEASE REMIT'T0: SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS 

6200 S. OAK PARK AVE. 
~Hlnvoic:e,H 

CHICAGO, IL 60638 
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From: marekr@cod.edu 
Sent: Thu Aug 16 15:14:19 CDT 2018 
To: invoicing@cod.edu 
CC: 
Subject: FW: Roy Houff invoice not paid # 102044658 43 .30 

Bobby Marek Accounts Payable Team Leader Cash Disbursements/Payroll Department College of DuPage 
425 Fawell Blvd l SRC 2132 l Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599 phone 630-942-2229 l marekr@cod.edu 
-----Original Message----- From: Hull, Amy Sent: Monday, August 13, 2018 2: 16 PM To: Marek, Robert 
Subject: Roy Houff invoice not paid #102044658 43.30 -----Original Message----- From: Hull, Amy Sent: 
Friday, May 18, 2018 11 :32 AM To: Hickman, Linda Subject: ok to pay Roy Houff Hi Linda, please process 
the attached invoice it is ok to pay. Thank you, Amy -----Original Message----- From: hullamy@cod.edu Sent: 
Friday, May 18, 2018 11 :25 AM To: Hull, Amy Subject: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer Please 
open the attached document. It was scanned and sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction Printer. Attachment 
File Type: pdf, Multi-Page Multifunction Printer Location: TEC Device Name: Printer-038 

[ attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer. pdf] 



 Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1194810
Vendor Name: Roy Houff Co., Llc
Invoice Number: 102055163
Invoice Date: 06/28/18
PO Number: 
Check Number: 0238312
Check Amount: $ 466.04
Check Date: 08/21/2018
Department ID: 00077
Reviewer Name: Linda Hickman
Voucher Number: V0523419
Redaction Type: None
Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



C9500 
COLLEGE OF DUPAGE~ C9500 
425 FAWELL BLVD 
SLEN ELLYN IL 60137 

PLEASE REMIT TO: 

6200 S. OAK PARK AVE. 

CHICAGO, IL 60638 

COLLEGE OF DUPAGE 
425 FAWELL BLVD 
SLEN 8-LYN IL 60137 

SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS 
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From: hullamy@cod.edu 
Sent: Thu Jun 28 14:08:09 CDT 2018 
To: invoicing@cod.edu 
CC: hickmanl@cod.edu,faykris@cod.edu 
Subject: ok to pay roy Houff BO 353521 

Please process the attached invoice for payment. Thank you, Amy Hull Amy Hull Greenhouse Supervisor 
College of DuPage TE0026 425 Fawell Blvd. Glen Ellyn, IL 60137 Phone: (630)942-3806 Fax: 
( 630)942-2965 hullamy@cod.edu 

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf] 



 Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1194810
Vendor Name: Roy Houff Co., Llc
Invoice Number: 102054387
Invoice Date: 06/25/18
PO Number: 
Check Number: 0238312
Check Amount: $ 466.04
Check Date: 08/21/2018
Department ID: 00077
Reviewer Name: Linda Hickman
Voucher Number: V0523421
Redaction Type: None
Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



C9500 
COLLEGE OF DUPAGE, C9500 
425 FAWELL BLVD 
GLEN ELLYN IL 60137 
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From: hullamy@cod.edu 
Sent: Mon Jun 25 13:35:56 CDT 2018 
To: hickmanl@cod.edu 
CC: invoicing@cod.edu 
Subject: ok to pay Roy Houff BO 353521 $193.53 

Linda, please process the attached invoice from Roy Houff BO 353521, thank you. Amy -----Original 
Message----- From: hullamy@cod.edu Sent: Monday, June 25, 2018 1 :30 PM To: Hull, Amy Subject: Scanned 
from a Xerox Multifunction Printer Please open the attached document. It was scanned and sent to you using a 
Xerox Multifunction Printer. Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page Multifunction Printer Location: TEC 
Device Name: Printer-038 

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf] 
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