Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1089293

Vendor Name: Steiner Electric Company
Invoice Number: S006049038.001
Invoice Date: 06/12/18

PO Number: P0358081

Check Number: 0238162

Check Amount: $ 1,655.74

Check Date: 08/15/2018

Department 1D: 00705

Reviewer Name:

Voucher Number: V0521020

Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: garciag{@cod.edu

Sent: Tue Jul 03 13:45:59 CDT 2018
To; invoicimg@cod.edu

€CC:

Subject: Invoices |5 cach

Clhntt,
GlendaGarcia | Administrative Assistant
Facifitios Opeeations
Cellege of DuPage
425 Fawelt Blvd. } CMC 10001 Glen Ellyn. IL 60137-6599
Phone (630)942-2314 | Fax (630)242-2136 garciag@cod.edu

Wbz 7 aflew qarpliody o smake you feef like you are nobody”
Dr. Martin Luther King, Ir.

"C.'.{rh’?w.r niist be e change pore want lo sée i the world”
Mahatma Gandhi
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SHIP TO:
‘ﬁC!‘Emg‘ MWI‘(‘ l.l COLLEGE OF DUPAGE
b2 Bed L) T 4 425 FAWELL BLVD
GLEN ELLYN, IL __60137-67 GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137
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IR Fare 24nf.12.18
Ifpaid-by—03/e/t8—yeu—may deduct [$-0.40
Invoice amount is due by 07/31/18
3. ROL RETORAS AORIECT TA TNSCECTION THAT MAY REEULT 11 RUGTOCAING CHAGHES. MATRRTAL ROm o Trmr=e==es """"""g@'ﬁa'ﬁgﬁ_’ s """"“'3:'2_'1“4‘"6"6"
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£ B0 o okace ML P G ko ds T e b M e e Sales Tax| = 0.00]
a tawable purchawss, you are veoponwibkla fur 41l applicoble tasxeo, intarost, and penaltice.
4. 1. 508 PER MINTH FInancll ChAVUE WiLL BE ADDED To ALL PASET DUC INVOICEE i
_....Amount Due 1214.06

** Reprint ** Reprint ** Reprint w*



Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1089293

Vendor Name: Steiner Electric Company
Invoice Number: S005424049.001BAL
Invoice Date: 06/30/16

PO Number: P0344331

Check Number: 0238162

Check Amount: $ 1,655.74

Check Date: 08/15/2018

Department 1D: 00705

Reviewer Name: Kathy Striplin
Voucher Number: V0521027
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



From: cruseb199(@cod.edu

Sent: Wed Jul 18 11:44:21 CDT 2018

To: invoicing@cod.edu

CC;

Subject: FW: Steiner's Electric Invoice - P0344331 - Pay with voucher FY'18

From: Striplin, Kathy

Sent: Wednesday, July 18, 2018 11:41 AM

To: Cruse, Bethany <cruseb199@cod.edu>

Subject: Steiner's Electric Invoice - P0344331 - Pay with voucher FY'18
Importance: High

Bethany,

We had to go back a couple of years to figure this out. But, yes, we do have to pay this.
Please pay with a voucher from FY’'18 — GL# 02-70-00705-5401004

Thank you.

Kathy

Kathy Striplin

College of DuPage

Facility Operations and Construction [ 425 Fawell Bivd [Glen Ellyn, IL 60137
striplin@cod.edu [o: 630-942-4082 [f: 630-942-2136

From: Cruse, Bethany

Sent: Wednesday, July 18, 2018 10:48 AM
To: Striplin, Kathy <striplin@cod.edu>
Subject: P0344331

Hello,
Steiner is looking for balance due, only $3,567.08 approved & paid. Please submit if balance is to be paid.

Thanks

Bethany Cruse

AP Lead

College of DuPage
Room SRC 2132

425 Fawell Boulevard
Glen Ellyn, IL 60137
630-942-4294
cruseb199@cod.edu



From: aodonnell@stnr.com

Sent: Mon Jul 16 13:07:35 CDT 2018
To: invoicing@cod.edu

B

Subject: Steiner Power Systems

Please see attached invoice. $441.68 is still due for payment.

Let me know if you have any questions
Thank you,

Allyson O’Donnell

Billing Coordinator

Power Systems Division
STEINER ELECTRIC COMPANY
1275 Touhy Avenue

Elk Grove Village, IL 60007

P: 847.956.3098 |x 5271
www.steinerelectric.com

ix_:ﬁ



STEINER

150 BT01:2008 Rogletered Form

= Eiectrical Supplies

= Automation Products

= Gaenerator Systems

= Energy Management Solutions

® Matora, Moter Repair & Drives

= Energy Efficient Lightinrg & Controls

STEINER ELECTRIC COMPAMY

» Matalworking & Industrial Supplles
= Barcodg & RFID Mobllity Sotutions
= Structured Cabling

= Natwork Infrastructure Products

= Safety & Janitarial Products

1-800-STEINER (783-4637) » www.steinarslectric.com

POWER SYS Marthem lllinala ~ Naorthwest Indiana
1275 TOUHY AVE sﬁfﬁéﬁ%ﬁ&;ﬂ* P— e O
o . & iz 218- I's
ELK GROVE VLG IL 60007-5301 foskrome  cumuss = meveasc wis:Z::i:::’OM
847-956-3058 Fax 847-950-5013 o oo = oo e ool AIATERMECIRICAL SUBSLY
8630-277-6E00 A2-421-7220 m 1-34G0 508-752.0485 Fax

5
EJQ-3TT-7852 Fax 312-808-5027 Fox  B15-485-1500 fax

COLLEGE OF DUPAGE

425 22ND S
GLEN ELLYN

SHIP TO:

06/30/16

Invoice

REMIT TO:
STEINER ELECTRIC COMPANY
2665 PAYSPHERE CIRCLE
CHICAGO IL 60674-0026

COLLEGE OF DUPAGE

BUrEDTINS—T
II. 60137-6784 jll’l’l{(iwmm, IL 60137

POWER SYSTEMS
INVOICE DETAILS TO FOLLOW

POWER SYSTEMS CITY SALES TAX
POWER SYSTEMS STATE SALES TaAX

BEST WAY
s g

SALES & SERVICE -

~ 4408.76
99.060/ea 99.06
165.090/ea 165.09

”

OKAY

INVOICE REVIEWED
TO PAY
TRIPLIN 07/18418

rgy 4
Pri i 725 /|
Prior Deposit on 10/14/16 4.15
Pxior Deposit onm 10/17/16 =400.00
SIGNATURE
Invoice amount is due by 07/31/16
1. ALL RETURNE SUBJECT TG INSPECTLION THAT RESULT IN RESTOCKING CHARGES. MATERIAL NOT
RETURNABLE WITHOUT pmmssmx.i sl S, Suthta'l 441 * 68
2. Te d Cenditi b nox be i alii
§47,208 400 O AE v, seinmratectrls Sai wEiok Drovisians DIATE B o e R, i GGHELLOE S&H CHGS 0.00
ith P d Conditi £ Purchaser’ 1 chase orde her document,
= B ‘;; yc:nﬁakgn:st:;-free ;urgll-'::gg :haici?T:terézgzzain:guéy a ;e;artll\;e:‘: :; g:ve;::;“:o be Sales Tax 0 o 00
2 taxable purchase, you are responsible for all applicable taxes, interest, and penalties.
4. 1.50% PER MONTE FINANCE CARRGE WILL BE ADDED TC ALL PAST DUE INVOICES
Amount Due 441.68

** Reprint ** Reprint ** Reprint **



STENER.

POWER SYSTEMS

CALL DETAILS

REFERENCE NO. SRVC03225
PO NUMBER 344331
TOTAL DUE .$4,672.91
BILL TO LOCATION
COLLEGE OF DUPAGE TECH BUILDING
BUILDING L 425 FAWELL BLVD
GLEN ELLYN, iL 60137 GLEN ELLYN, IL60137
Phone: {630) 858-2800
Description TIME AND MATERIAL FIRST TRIP - SECOND TRIP QUOTED COST
Service Call #160315-0013 QTE R/R FUEL iNJ PUMP/16 LIGHT BRD
Salesperson ~ Service Cust No._Steiner Cust No, __Order Date mpletion D Payment Terms __ Technician
117085 1806 4/20/2016 6/1/2016 LID1CN30TH DLEDESMA
Equipment Type: 5/N: Model:
Detail of Charges
‘Charge Description. 7 i - Total
ON SITE LABOR $1,575.32
TRAVEL LABOR $128.00
PARTS 52,641.44
40669 KOHLER A-336432 EA 1.00 5227.63 $227.63
PCB ASSY 16 LIGHT
704041 MFi INJECTION PUMP EA 1.00 $2,372.13 $2,372.13
REBUILD SERVICE .' -
45827 KQOHLER 336661 FUEL EA 1.00 $15.58 §15.58
FILTER o
836994 ALLFLEET ELC GAL 2.00 £13.05 $26.10
ANTIFREEZE 50/50 '
(RED)
OTHER (MILEAGE) $ 64.00
Subtotal . 54,408.76
Total Ta» 526415
Amount Paid $0.00
Total $4,672.91

1. ALL RETURNS SUBJECT TO INSPECTION THAT MAY RESULT IN RESTOCKING CHARGES. MATERIAL NOT RETURNABLE WITHOUT PERMISSION,

2. Terms and conditicns may be obtained by calling (847) 228-0400 or at www.sleinerelectric.cam, which provisions shall govern in the extent of any conflick with any
Terms and Conditions of Purchaser's propesal, purchase order or other document.
3. If you make a tax-free purchase that is later determined by a Department cf Revenue to be 3 taxable purchase, you are responsible for alt applicable taxes, interest and

penalties. Tax information may be obtained at http:/fwww.stelnerelectric.com/index.jsp?path=taxinfo

4. 1.5% PER MONTH FINANCE CHARGE WILL BE ADDED TO ALL PAST DUE INVOICES



Call Summary

POWER SYSTEMS

1250 Touhy Ave

Elk Grove Village, IL 60007
Phone:(847) 956-3098
www steinerelectric.com

Customer Name / Location Contact Phone

|COLLEGE OF DUPAGE / TECH BUILDING | [BILL | (630) 942-2129 x0000 |
Address City State Zip

|425 FAWELL BLVD |GLEN ELLYN | L | |s0137 B
Service Call ID Date Call Creation Date

[160315-0013 | 6/30/2018 | [3/15/2016 |
Description Problem

{R/R FUEL INJ PUMP/16 LIGHT BRD |
Primary Technician Call Type P.O. #

{LeDesma, Dominic | |QUOTED SERVICE | [344331 |

APPOINTMENTS COMPLETE
[4/20/2016 2:59:46 PM DLEDESMA]

with the pump ASAP.

We will adjust the quote as needed.

[6/27/2016 11:17:56 AM DLEDESMA]

Unit is OK and in service

Removed fuel injection pump and dropped off at Midwest fuet injection. Changed out the 16 light circuit board. We will return

When | removed the side cover of the pump | saw even more corrosion and varnish. | will ask Midwest fuel injection their
opinion on the fuel additives but it might be better to just drain and replace the fuel.

1) job was quoted for replacing the injection pump but the correct configuration with electronic governor was not available. If |

remove the top cover of the pump the warranty will be void. | talked to the customer and he agreed that | could remove the
pump and send it out for repair as | originally recommended.

Installed rebuilt injection pump. Test run with and without load. Replace fuel filter. Check for leaks.

Appointments

Technician |Appointment

Dominic LeDesma 0001

iDate’

|Status

4/20/2016| COMPLETE

iCompietion Da?eﬂ
- 4/20/2016/

Dominic |.eDesma 0002

6/27/2016|COMPLETE

6/1/2016

Model: KOHLER 30REOZJB

S/N: 2212828

o e e e e e e .6 . 8 8 i e e e 5 e B ot e ot et e et e e

[Task Status

1
iResponse

6uantity

. Descri ption

14/7/2016 1.00]40669 KOHLER A-336432 PCB ASSY 16 LIGHT o
4712016 1.00|RE519015 DEERE RE519015 INJECTION PUMP
4/18/2016 1.00|DC70025-002-012 WOODWARD DC70025-002-012 ACTUATOR

Page 1 of 2



Call Summary

e Jaustty . i TR
4/27/2016 -1.00{RE519015 DEERE RES518015 INJECTION PUMP
4/27/12016 -1.00{DC70025-002-012 WOODWARD DC70025-002-012 ACTUATOR
5/3/2016 1.00{704041 MF1 INJECTICN PUMP REBUILD SERVICE
l5!3;2’7.016 -1.00[|RE519015 DEERE RE519015 INJECTION PUMP
5/3/2016 -1.00|DC70025-002-012 WOODWARD DC70025-002-012 ACTUATOR
5/3/12016 1.00{RE518015 DEERE RES519015 INJECTION PUMP
5/3/2016 1.00|DC70025-002-012 WOODWARD DC70025-002-012 ACTUATOR
5/12/2016 1.00{45827 KOHLER 336661 FUEL FILTER
6/29/2016 2.001836994 ALLFLEET ELC ANTIFREEZE 50/50 (RED)

Steiner PowerSystems thanks you for allowing us to assist you with your generator maintenance needs. We hope we have
provided you with the prompt and high quality service that you deserve. Feel free to contact Steiner PowerSystems for your
full service generator sales and service needs. If you have any questions or further needs please call 1-847-956-3098

Services and/or repairs are subject to Steiner's Terms & Conditions which may be obtained contacting Steiner PowerSystems
by calling 1-800-Steiner or at www.steinerelectric.com., Your terms are LIDION30TH

Page 2 of 2
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