Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1513244

Vendor Name: Innovate Technologies, Inc
Invoice Number: 16343

Invoice Date: 07/10/18

PO Number: P0356619

Check Number: 0237745

Check Amount: $ 40,032.00

Check Date: 08/02/2018

Department 1D: 00089

Reviewer Name: Linda Hickman
Voucher Number: V0521436
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



From: helena@innovatetec.com
Sent: Thu Jul 12 10:12:32 CDT 2018
To: invoicing@cod.edu

CC: filipek@cod.edu

Subject: New Invoice from Innovate Technologies, Inc.

Dear Customer :

Please find attached new invoice.
Thank you!

Helena Peter,
Office Manager

Innovate Technologies, Inc.
761 N. 17th St., Unit #5
St. Charles, IL 60174

(630) 587-4220 - Tel

(630) 587-4219 - Fax
helena@innovatetec.com
www.innovatetec.com

Exclusive Dealer of Mitsubishi EDM, EDM Consumables, Milling, and
Waterjet



»Iinnovate

TECHNOLOGIES | NGOG. Invoice

761 N. 17th Street _
Unit #5 . Date Invoice #

St. Charles, IL 60174 7/10/2018 16343

College of Dupage Colle.g.e of DupaQe

Attn: NP Dept W

425 Fawall Blv Glen Ellyn, IL 60137

Glen Ellyn, IL 6p137 j‘l’ l’ l{("r l? l)
4

07/19/18 - KRISTINE FAY

356619 Net 30 JT 7/10/2018 PTR Services

aty ltem Code Besoipion

1 Mitsui MSG-ébDMH ' New Mitsui Manual’.Sﬁﬁace Grindér .Model
MSG-200MH S/N 040-11275, Per Innovate Proposal#
7777547

Price Each  Amount

14003200  40,032.00

INVOICE REVIEWED
OKAY TO PAY
LINDA HICKMAN 04/18/18

Building American Manufacturing
- One Machine Tool At A Time

Thank you for your business.

Total $40,032.00

I ?;}tvf.._.-_Ph'OJ].e';.#i Fax

630-587-4220 630-587-4219 www.innovatetec.com



o

o

whr
2

M

PR

Mg

- AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

SEF?VIGES

LLC

BILL TO:

e /f‘)’é/{/’ /?}'I AZ/ i' { //;A"fr!/// /‘;’

PTR SERVICES, LLC
11N625 WHISPERING OAKS DR.
HAMPSHIRE, IL 60140
224-629-9464 ROBERT@PTRSERVICES.NET

SRRLA O WA '
/ /r: /r i 7/, é&f%?
ATTENTION: ' g R

' ORDER' SUMMARY,

| Sk qu

CFSY el éar GAE é"/"//(,o&/f

Sel AMgckrice at ]D/ar_:c_

DATE: — [/ [. . : ’ .
Zhofty Po 2866\T =/ [wif

ORDER TAKEN BY: PHONE NO. - v

STARTING DATE: JOB LOCATION:

TERMS:

JOB PHONE . B . ;

S ey e e ey

AIVIOUNT

3G Jod AH
Sy o4p-11275

¢ |)
A P
405%™

et p2 ey A e

* o0

see s oo

- L

sstoe pecese

L ] *ed

* ° cosns

. » .‘.... : o

L ] L] L ] [ X ’

LR N o0 . -

[] * lioios eve VMT

* ¢ @ -

LA N N N} [ ] L

[ ) L ] :
L ] *e p o L [ )
20 00
) TOTAL LABOR & MATERIALS
. WORK ORDERED ay:
o o TOTAL MISC.

DATE ORDERED / /. DATE COMPLETED: Z / :

CUSTOMER APPROVAL SIGNATURE

.,f/

GRAND TOTAL

AT

/2, N !//Jf




From: Virgitio, David

To: Filipek, James; Fay, Kristine; Havley, Robert; Stella, Antoinette
Subject: RE: Mitsui Grinder ’
Date: Thursday, June 21, 2018 9:30:22 AM

Thanks Jim,

| share your frustration with the vendor... especially dilficult news to hear so close to year-end! 1 think the best way
10 go about this (really the only way) would be to record this expense in the period that we actually receive the -
equipment. If, by some great fortune, we receive it prior to June 30, we can make sure to record it in FY2018.
However, if it does indeed get delayed until July 3, we will need to show it as an FY2019 expense.

This shouldn't be a major issue though, which is why [ have copied Bob and Toni on this email. They can swork with
you to find FY 19 budget dollars from elsewhere that can be used to cover the cost of this expense. Even at the very
start of a fiscal year there may be projects or anticipated costs that we know arc not going to occur as planned, and
so we can transfer that over (o the account number this is being paid out of.

Please keep us posted on the status of the delivery,

Thanks!

David P. Virgilio, CPA

Assistant Financial Controller 1 Financial Affairs

College of DuPage

425 Fawell Blvd. | SRC 2130M 1 Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599 | USA

phone 630.942.3028 1 fax 630.942.2297 | virgiliod@cod.edu

Want to learn more about our Chart of Accounis? Click Here

From: Filipek, James

Sent: Thursday, June 21, 2018 9:18 AM

To: Virgilio, David <virgiliod@cod.edu>: Fay, Kristine <favkris@cod.edu>

Subject: RE: Mitsui Grinder

ALCON:

The amount is $40,032.00 PO #356619.

Again, thanks to all for helping me with this.

Jim Filipek

From: Virgilio, David

Sent: Thursday, June 21, 2018 6:07 AM
To: Fay, Kristine

Cec: Filipek, James

Subject: Re: Mitsui Grinder

Fli Kris, can yvou let me know the total S we are talking about?

-DV

On Jun 20, 2018, at 6:18 PV, Fay, Kristine <laykris@cod.edu<mailio: faykrisi'cod .edu>> wrote:



Hi Dave-

Heads up that we are anticipating a post June 28 delivery date o our FY 18 capital equipment—a Mitsui grinder that
was ordered months ago. In early May we were told delivery would be June 22, now they are telling us July 3. The
details are below. Please advise next steps for us to facilitate use ol the encumbered FY 18 funds for this equipment.
Thank you- -

Kris

Kris Fay
Dean, Business & Technology
630.942,3505

From: Filipek, James .

Sent: Monday, June 18, 2018 11:25 AM

To: Fay, Kristine <faykris@cod.edu<mailto:faykris
<tumavich@cod.edu<mailio:tumavich@cod.edu>>

Subject: Fwd: Mitsui Grinder

u>>; Tumavich, James

Kris, newest update on this years capital cquipment. [ am not happy!!!
Jim

Sent from my phone

Bcgin i'orwarded mcssage'

Date: Junc. 18,2018 at 11:10:55 CDT
To: "Filipek, James” <filipek@cod.edu<gailto:{ilipekicad.cdu>>, Joc Talarczyk
<joe@innovatetec.com<mailto:j |g)§~'g innovatetec.con>>
. Cc: "Tumavich, James” <tumavich@cod. cdu< ailo:tumavichviicod edu>>
soors mmm s = Qubject: RE: Mitsui Grinder- - ~— -+ - o B e s s eSS SRR R A R
Hi Jim,

We received an update from Mitsui on Friday, but [ was not in the office o forward to you. Looks like we have
small delay for about another week per the email below. [ will definitely be checking with them every few days to
sec if there is an update to send to you. A

Hello Helena, Joe,

| just got out of our assembly schedule meeting, and our records indicate that you have placed a PO for a machine
that was due in on our JUNE ETA USA container, to be shipped to the College of Dupage.

Please note that due to forces beyond our control, including but not limited to congestion at the port in both Japan

and, the West coast as well as freight train shortages duc to possible strikes by rail unions, this container has been

delayed during shipping for 25 days. Though we typically receive the freight within the first week of each month,

this container is now not expected 1o Teach ( Chicago until top/duly. N - 0 o
Machines on this container will be delivered in the order in which the POs were received, though machine ready

dates will be delayed irom the original quoted lead time accordingly.

————— e —

Rest assured we are doing everything in our power to move these machines as soon as the container arrives o our
location, including setting up vendor appointments, preparing warchouse space, and ensuring that all of the required
parts are available and in stock. I will be sending out individual emails with the new expected ready date. Your
machine will be the first shipped afler the container arrives.

Based on the information from today’s assembly schedute meeting, the current expected ready date of yvour machine



is July 3rd.

Thank you for vour patience and understanding. We will continuc lo keep you updated as we go forward especially
il'the ready date changes from that day.

Sincerely,

Daniel Doyen Assistant Manager, Okaya (U.S.A), Inc.

Helena

From: Filipek, James <filipck@cod.edu<mailto:filipekigicod.edu>>

Sent: Tuesday, June 12, 2018 10:14 AM

To: Helena Peter <hclena@innovatetec.com<mailtoshelena@innovatetec.com>>; Joe Talarczyk
<joc@innovatetec.com<mailto:joef@innovatetec com>>

Cc: Tumavich, James <tumavich@cod.edu<mailtofumavich/@cod,edu>>

Subject: RE: Mitsui Grinder

Helena,
Thanks so much for the update. We will plan accordingly! .
Jim Filipek

From: Helena Peter <helenaf@innovatetec.com<mailto:helenal@

Sent: Tuesday, June 12, 2018 10:12 AM

To: Filipek, James <filipck@cod.edu<mailio:filipekaicod.edu>>; Joc Talarczyk
<joe@innovatetec.com<mailto:joe/@innovatetec.com>>

Ce: Tumavich, James <tumavich@ecod.edu<mailtotumavichizecod.edu>>
Subject: RE: Mitsui Grinder

i him, y

Hope you are having a nice start to summer!

I have been checking in with Mitsui weekly regarding your grinder delivery and up until the ship docked in
California we were on schedule. However, when | inquired yesterday [ received the below email regarding the
delay at the port. Right now, it looks like it is about 1 weck delaved from the originat schedule. | will check with
them daily and let you know later this weck where we stand.

Felena,

Unfortunately, it seems that the containers did not move [rom the West Coast container yard over the weekend as we
hoped, and in fact has not moved as of yet. I'm being told winds and weather on the West Coast last weekend and
heavy vessel congestion are the culprits.

We have red flagged both containers to move our way as soon as possible and are recciving daily updates as to the
progress. Currently, 1'm hearing ETD West Coast 6/13 as a best case scenario, though we won®t know until the
containers get loaded and moving. '

It's usually 6 days via train from the west coast to Chicago, though that does not include de-ramping and unloading
at Chicago, which usually takes another day or two depending on truck and forklift availability.

1 would say at this time it’s unlikely we get the containers 1o Chicago (not to mention get the container unloaded and
get your machines built) until the week of 6/23.

As ol'now, we have all of the neeessary vendors Hned up and ready o go as soon as the machine gets here and will
do everything we can to expedite your build once we actually get our hands on the machine. The College of Dupage




machine will be the first on our schedule once the container arrives.

Sincerely,
Dan

Helena Peter,

Office Manager

Innovate Manufacturing Technologies, Inc.

761 N. | 7th St., Unit #5

St. Charles, 1. 60174

(630) 587-4220 — Tel

(630) 587-4219 - Fax
helena@innovatetec.com<mailto:helena@iinnovatetec.com>
wiww innovatetec.com<http:/Avwav.innovatetec,com/>

Exclusive Dealer of Mitsubishi EDM, EDM Consumables, Milling & Lathes <image001.jpg>

From: Filipek, James <filipek{@cod.cdu<mailto:fili
Sent: Thursday, May 10, 2018 10:18 AM

To: Helena Peter <helcna@mnovaietec com<
<joc@innovatelec.com<ni i
Cc: Tumavich, James <lumavthcod edu<

>>: Joe Talarczyk

ytumavich@acod.edu>>

_ Subject: RE: Mitsui Grinder .

This is great news, | hope they have smooth sailing and that will meet our needs just finc.

We will be purchasing another grinder after July Ist. I will begin working on the package in June and the timeline

will not:be as tight.

Thanks,
Jim

From: Helena Peter <hclena@innovatetec.com<
Sent: Thursday, May 10, 2018 9:59 AM

To: Filipek, James <hhpcl~.@c0d cdu<
<joe@innovatetec.com<majllo;
Cc: Tumavich, James <tumavlch@c0d cdu<nm1LLQ,jm1_\_mm>> FFay, Kristine
<faykris@cod.edu<mailio:lay

Subject: RE: Mitsui Grinder

Hi Jim,

1 am still waiting for an exact ETA on the container Shlpplﬂ" from Jdpan but rloht now thev are saving arriving at

Mitsui in Arlington Hts, on 6/18 and you are the lirst in line to install the options. So we could deliver the machine

to vou no later than 6/22 on schedule.
I will keep vou posted if anything changes at all!
Thanks!

Felena Peter,
Office Manager



Innovate Manufacturing Technologies, Inc.

761 N. 17th St., Unit #35

St. Charles, I, 60174

(630) 587-4220 — Tel

(630) 587-4219 — Fax
helenagginnovatetec.com<maiito:helena/@innovateiee.com>
wwv.innovatelee.com<hiipi/www jnnovateleg.coms>

Exclusive Dealer of Mitsubishi EDM, EDM Consumables, Milling & Lathes <image001 .jpe>

From: Filipek, James <filipek{@gcod.edu<n
Sent: Tuesday, May 8, 2018 7:52 AM

To: Joe Talarczyk <joe@innovatetec.com<mailic:jgeidinnovatetec.com>>; Helena Peter
<helena@innovatetec.com<inailto:helena@innovatetec.com>>

Ce: Tumavich, James <tumavich@cod.edu<mailto:lumavichiidcod.edu>>; Fay, Kristine
<faykris@)cod.edu<nailto:faykiisicicod.edu>>

Subject: Mitsui Grinder

Joe and IHelena,
Might you have a projected date for delivery of our Mitsui surface grinder?

Jim Filipek
College of DuPage
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