Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1089360

Vendor Name: Warehouse Direct, Inc.
Invoice Number: 3931382-0

Invoice Date: 06/25/18

PO Number: PO358079

Check Number: E0068308

Check Amount: $2,917.95

Check Date: 07/19/2018

Department I1D: 00689

Reviewer Name: Kathy Striplin
Voucher Number: V0519302
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



From: ar@warehousedirect.com

Sent: Mon Jun 25 09:57:23 CDT 2018

To: invoicing@cod.edu

CC;

Subject: Invoices for 6/25/2018 from Warehouse Direct

Please find your invoice(s) from Warehouse Direct attached.

[attachment: WDInvoice.PDF]



WarEHOUSE DIRECT ’ INVOICE
WORKPLACE SOLUTIONS 6/25/2018 3931382-0

2001 S. Mount Prospect Rd. DATE NUMBER
Des Plaines, IL 60018

(847) 952-1925 Fax: (847) 956-5815
www.warechousedirect.com

Billing Address ippi
COLLEGE OF DURAGE 1‘1) l)mmli

COMMUNITY COLLEGE 502 COMMUNITY COLLEGE #502
4 ] N h | 4N
425 FAWELL BLV ) / ( / :g = (]M#*vg J () T \{ 1(
GLEN ELLYN, IL 13( g l ) l ‘l had) 1’ l “ I‘Rl]‘ 4
Customer Number | Dept Customer Purchase Order Salesrep Writer Terms
M108658 425 MONICA| 6245 5047 NET 30 DAYS VIA
EFT OR CHECK
Order|UM | BO [Ship| MFG |  Stock Number | Description | Unit Price |~ Extended
1 EA 1 AND 280622154-UC WTRHG FASH,6'X22' CHAR $561.95 $561.95
2 EA 2 AND 28046154 MAT WTRHG,280,4X6 #154 CHAR $88.50 $177.00
2 EA 2 AND 280310154-UC WTRHG FASH,3'X10',CHAR $110.70 $221.40
1 EA 1 WHD FREIGHT61 FREIGHT $244.71 $244.71

SubTotal $1,205.06
Tax $0.00
Total $1,205.06

INVOICE REVIEWED
OKAY TO PAY
KATHY STRIPLIN 07/12/14

%

THANK YOU FOR YOUR ORDER

Page 1 of 1



From: cruseb199(@cod.edu

Sent: Tue Jul 17 09:12:52 CDT 2018

To: invoicing@cod.edu

CC;

Subject: FW: Warehouse Direct Credit C3931382-0 - Apply toward invoice 3931382-0 (already approved) for
shipping

From: Striplin, Kathy

Sent: Monday, July 16, 2018 9:53 AM

To: Cruse, Bethany <cruseb199@cod.edu >

Subject: Warehouse Direct Credit C3931382-0 - Apply toward invoice 3931382-0 (already approved) for shipping
Importance: High

Please process the attached credit along with the invoice. We are not paying the shipping on the invoice and this is the credit.
Thank you.
Kathy

Kathy Striplin

College of DuPage

Facility Operations and Construction [ 425 Fawell Bivd [Glen Ellyn, IL 60137
striplin@cod.edu [o: 630-942-4082 [f: 630-942-2136

From: Chowaniec, Monica

Sent: Monday, July 16, 2018 9:46 AM

To: Striplin, Kathy <striplin@cod.edu>

Subject: FW: Warehouse Direct Invoice for Addison Floormats

Good Morning Kathy,

Warehouse Direct has given us a credit for the freight.
Please let me know if you have any questions.
Thanks,

Monica

From: Sabrina Coutee <scoutee@warehousedirect.com >

Sent: Monday, July 16, 2018 8:17 AM

To: Steve Hyde <stevehyde@warehousedirect.com>; Chowaniec, Monica <chowaniecm157@cod.edu>
Subject: RE: Warehouse Direct Invoice for Addison Floormats

Good morning,
Sorry about the freight charge, the credit is attached. Thank you

Thank you have a great day

Sabnina (Coutee



Email: scoutee@warehousedirect.com
Phone# 847-631-7193 Faxi# 847-956-5815

M B |9
é?"%

2001 South Mount Prospect Road, Des Plaines, IL 60018
Salon Essentials/ Metro Professional Products/ Victor Supply

After 5 pm Call Customer Service: 847-952-1925
After 5 pm please email:customerservice@warehousedirect.com

Office & Technology Products / Furniture & Design / Document Management / Janitorial & Industrial / Coffee & Breakroom /
Printing & Promotional

From: Steve Hyde

Sent: Monday, July 16, 2018 7:49 AM

To: Chowaniec, Monica

Cc: Sabrina Coutee

Subject: Re: Warehouse Direct Invoice for Addison Floormats

Tell them to short pay

Thank You,

Steve Hyde

Metro Prof Prod

a div of Warehouse Direct

OnJul 16, 2018, at 7:35 AM, Chowaniec, Monica <chowaniecm157@cod.edu > wrote:

Hi Steven,
Please let me know.

From: Striplin, Kathy

Sent: Thursday, July 12, 2018 3:52 PM

To: Chowaniec, Monica <chowaniecm157 @cod.edu>
Subject: Warehouse Direct Invoice for Addison Floormats

Monica,

| verified this invoice; however, there is not enough on the PO to pay this because they are charging $244.71 in freight.
That seems really excessive. However, our A/P Department will only go up to 10% of the cost of the PO (without
Freight). Since that will not be enough to pay this, we should just pay the amount that was on the PO, $50. They can
send a separate invoice for the difference, but | would question this cost.

Kathy
<Default page2.tif>



S AT CREDIT
WAREHOUSE DIRECT CREDIT NUMBER| 39313820 |

WORKPLACE SOLUTIONS

CREDIT DATE| 07/16/18 |
2001 S MOUNT PROSPECT RD
DES PLAINES, IL 60018 ACCOUNT NUMBER | 4108658 |
Phone: (847) 952-1925 Fax: (847) 956-5815
www.warehousedirect.com DEPT NUMBERl 425 |
Page 1 of 1

BILLTO ADDRESS

SHIPTO ADDRESS

COLLEGE OF DUPAGE COLLEGE OF DUPAGE
COMMUNITY COLLEGE 502 COMMUNITY COLLEGE #502
425 FAWELL BLVD 425 FAWELL BLVD
630-942-2216
SHORT PURCHASE ORDER LONG PURCHASE ORDER SALESPERSON
358079 358079 6245 i g
ITEMNUMBER  MFG ITEM DESCRIPTION B oy o iy (FSELLPRICE, | IENDED
FREIGHT®1 WHD| FREIGHT EA| 1 1 244.71 244.71
PA/CM
PRICING PER REP
CREDIT EXPIRES IN 12 MONTHS Subtotal 244.71
Tax
Thank you for your order! -244.71
Want fewer invoices to process and vendors to manage? Ask us how.
Office Supplies * Copiers, Printers & Technology « Managed IT Services « Furniture, Interiors & Design « Safety, Industrial & MRO
Janitorial Supplies & Equipment « Coffee Equipment & Breakroom « Food Service & Packaging « Printing & Promotional




Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1089360

Vendor Name: Warehouse Direct, Inc.
Invoice Number: 3944827-1

Invoice Date: 06/27/18

PO Number: P0358674

Check Number: E0068308

Check Amount: $2,917.95

Check Date: 07/19/2018

Department I1D: 00689

Reviewer Name:

Voucher Number: V0520828
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: ar@warehousedirect.com

Sent: Wed Jun 27 09:58:51 CDT 2018

To: invoicing@cod.edu

B

Subject: Invoices for 6/27/2018 from Warehouse Direct

Please find your invoice(s) from Warehouse Direct attached.

[attachment: WDInvoice.PDF]



> D
WaREHOUSE DIRECT INVOICE
WORKPLACE SOLUTIONS 6/27/2018 3944827-1
2001 S. Mount Prospect Rd. DATE NUMBER
Des Plaines, IL 60018
(847) 952-1925 Fax: (847) 956-5815
www.warehousedirect.com
& T 4 r 1(1
3 WAY MATCH
Billing Address Shipping Address
COLLEGE OF DUPAGE COLLEGE OF DUPAGE
COMMUNITY COLLEGE 502 COMMUNITY COLLEGE #502
425 FAWELL BLVD 425 FAWELL BLVD
GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137 GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137
Customer Number | Dept Customer Purchase Order Salesrep Writer Terms
M108658 425 358674 6245 5087 NET 30 DAYS VIA
EFT OR CHECK
Order | UM | BO |Ship| MFG |  StockNumber | Description | Unit Price | Extended
**Attention :Monica Chowaniec
7 EA 7 RCP Q745 HANDLE,QK CNNCT,20-40", YL $10.95 $76.65
4 EA 4 RCP Q745 HANDLE,QK CNNCT,20-40", YL $10.95 $43.80

SubTotal  $120.45

THANK YOU FOR YOUR ORDER

Tax $0.00
Total $120.45

Page 1 of 1




Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1089360

Vendor Name: Warehouse Direct, Inc.
Invoice Number: C3938500-0
Invoice Date: 06/28/18

PO Number: P0358413

Check Number: E0068308

Check Amount: $2,917.95

Check Date: 07/19/2018

Department I1D: 00689

Reviewer Name: Kathy Striplin
Voucher Number: V0520986
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



From: ar@warchouscdirect.com

Sent: Thu Jun 28 09:59:12 CDT 2018

To: invoicingigeod.edu

Lo

Subject: Invoices tor 6/28/2018 from Warchouse Direct

Please find your invoice(s) trom Warchouse Dircct atiached.
b

[attachment: WDInvoice.PDI']




I AREHOUSE IDIRECT INVOICE

WORKPLACE SQLUTIONS 6/28/2018 C3938500-0
2001 S. Mount Prospect Rd. DATE NUMBER

Des Plaines, TL 60018
(847) 932-1925 Fax: (847) 956-58135
ww_w.wm'ehuusedirect.cum

APPROVED

Billing Addre m ;im‘ 7 T -
coucceorole)'d 1 8/18 - MO ¢ sHOWANIEC
COMMUNITY CELLEGE § MMUNITY COLLEGE #50
425 FAWELL BLVE TRV BLvD
GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137 ; GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137
Customer Number | Dept |  Customer Purchase Order | Salesrep | writer | Terms |
M108658 425 358413| 6245 6044 NET 30 DAYS VIA
EFT OR CHECK
In Returns

2 EA -2RCP 617388BK CART,JANITOR WIBAG,BK $159.00 ($318.00)

SubTotal ($318.00)

CREDIT EXPIRES IN 12 MONTHS. Tax $0.00
Total  ($318.00)

INVOICE REVIEWED
OKAY TO PAY
KATHY STRIPLIN 07/18/1.

THANK YOU FOR YOUR ORDER
Page 1 of 1



Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1089360

Vendor Name: Warehouse Direct, Inc.
Invoice Number: C3934094-0
Invoice Date: 06/28/18

PO Number: P0358413

Check Number: E0068308

Check Amount: $2,917.95

Check Date: 07/19/2018

Department I1D: 00689

Reviewer Name: Kathy Striplin
Voucher Number: V0520990
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



From: ar@warchouscdirect.com

Sent: Thu Jun 28 09:59:12 CDT 2018

To: invoicingi@eod.edu

3 G

Subject: Invoices tor 6/28/2018 from Warchouse Direct

Please find your invoice(s) tfrom Warehouse Direct attached.

[attachment: WDInvoice.PDF]




WY AREHOUSE DIRECT INVOICE

WORKPLACE SOQLUTIONS 6/28/2018 C3934094-0
2001 S, Mount Prospect Rd. DATE NUMBER

Des Plaines, TL 60018
(847) 952-1925 Fax: (847) 956-5815
www.warehousedirect.com

APPROVED
conceor e (/18/18 - MOXTCATHOWANIEC

COMMUNITY C:
425 FAWELL BLVD 425 FAWELL BLVD
GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137 GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137
| Cuslo_h;FNuﬁ"berm[__Dept ] Customer Purchase Order Wl_ S_é_l;:s@;_  Writer ]w " Terms

NET 30 DAYS VIA
EFT OR CHECK

In Returns

2 EA -2RCP 9TBE00BLA CART,UTILITY HVY DTY,BK $159.00 ($318.00)

SubTotal ($318.00)

CREDIT EXPIRES IN 12 MONTHS. Tax $0.00
Total  ($318.00)

INVOICE REVIEWED
OKAY TO PAY
KATHY STRIPLIN 07/18/1d

-

THANK YOU FOR YOUR ORDER
Page 1of 1



Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1089360

Vendor Name: Warehouse Direct, Inc.
Invoice Number: 3945170-0

Invoice Date: 06/28/18

PO Number: P0358674

Check Number: E0068308

Check Amount: $2,917.95

Check Date: 07/19/2018

Department I1D: 00689

Reviewer Name: Kathy Striplin
Voucher Number: V0520993
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



From: arf@warchousedirect.com

Sent: Thu Jun 28 09:59:12 CD'T 2018

To: invoicing@cod.edu

CC:

Subject: Invoices for 6/28/2018 from Warchouse Direct

Pleasc find your invoice(s) from Warchouse Direct attached.

[attachment: WDInvoice. PDI]




B e ]
WORKPLACE SQOLUTIONS 6/28/2018 3945170-0
2001 §. Mount Prospect Rd. DATE NUMBER

Des Plaines, TIL 60018

TAREHOUSE IIRECT INVOICE

(847) 952-1925 Fax: (847) 956-5815
www, warchousedirect.com

Billing Address Shipping Address
COLLEGE OF DUPAG COLLEGE OF DUPAGE
COMMUNITY CCLLE 502 1‘1‘1‘#‘?‘3%”02
425 FAWELL BLVD LL BL

e 07/ 18/18 - MONICA'CHOWANIEC

! Customer Number | Dept Customer Purchase Order Salesrep Writer Terms
M108658 425 358674 6245 5087 NET 30 DAYS VIA
: EFT OR CHECK

EA
EA
EA
EA
EA

R VLT R W o [

**Attention :Monica Chowaniec

1WHD FREIGHTS1 FREIGHT $0.00 $0.00
4 WND 86340500 BRUSH ASSEMBLY COMPLETE $61.20 $244.80
2WND 86342160 SIDE BROOM $20.20 $40.40
2WND 86008650 PIN,.25 COTTER RING $3.00 $6.00

2WND 86328040 PIN, 25" CLEVIS $4.00 $8.00

SubTotal $299.20
Tax $0.00
Total $299.20

INVOICE REVIEWED
OKAY TO PAY
KATHY STRIPLIN 07/18/1:

THANK YOU FOR YOUR ORDER
Page 1 of 1



Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1089360

Vendor Name: Warehouse Direct, Inc.
Invoice Number: 3944827-0

Invoice Date: 06/26/18

PO Number: P0358674

Check Number: E0068308

Check Amount: $2,917.95

Check Date: 07/19/2018

Department I1D: 00689

Reviewer Name:

Voucher Number: V0520996
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



From: ar@warchousedirect.com

Sent: "Tue Jun 26 09:58:36 CDT 2018

To: mvoicingeod.edu

CC: :

Subject: Invoices for 6/26/2018 from Warchouse Direct

Please find your invoice(s) from Warchouse Direct attached.

[attachment: WDInvoice.PDF]



AREHOUSE IDTRECT INVOICE
WORKPLACE SQLUTIONS 6/26/2018 3944827-0
2001 S. Mount Prospect Rd. DATE NUMBER
Des Plaines, TL 60018
(847) 952-1925 Fax: (847) 956-5815
www.warehousedirect.com
3 WAY MATCH
3 WAY MATC
Billing Address Shipping Address
COLLEGE OF DUPAGE COLLEGE OF DUPAGE
COMMUNITY CCLLEGE 502 COMMUNITY COLLEGE #502
425 FAWELL BLVD 425 FAWELL BLVD
GLEN ELLYN, 1L 60137 GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137
Customer Number | Dept [ Customer Purchase Order | Salesrep Writer { Terms __F]

M108658 425

358674| 6245

**Attention :Monica Chowaniec

5087 NET 30 DAYS VIA

EFT OR CHECK

2 EA 2RCP 617388BK CART,JANITOR W/BAG, BK $159.00 $318.00
9 EA 9RCP Q745 ' HANDLE,QK CNNCT 20-40" YL 510_95' $98.55
7 EA 7 ORCP Q745 HANDLE,QK CNNCT,20-40", YL $10.95 $0.00
4 EA 4 0RCP Q745 HANDLE,QK CNNCT,20-40", YL $10.95 $0.00
4 EA 4 RCP Q559BLA FRAME ECON PLAS, 18" BK $14.95 $59.80
12 EA 12 RCP Qass9BLA FRAME ECON PLAS,18",BK $14.95 $179.40
4 EA 4 RCP QL59BLA FRAME,ECON PLAS,18",BK $14.95 $SQ.80
SubTotal ~ $715.55
Tax $0.00
Total  $715.55

[ THANK YOU FOR YOUR ORDER

Page 1 of 1




Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1089360

Vendor Name: Warehouse Direct, Inc.
Invoice Number: 3938500-0

Invoice Date: 06/26/18

PO Number: P0358413

Check Number: E0068308

Check Amount: $2,917.95

Check Date: 07/19/2018

Department I1D: 00689

Reviewer Name: Kathy Striplin
Voucher Number: V0521000
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



From: ari@warchousedirect.com

Sent: Tue Jun 26 09:58:36 CDT 2018

To: mvoicingiwcod.edu

s e
" Subject: Invoices for 6/26/2018 from Warchouse Direct

Please tind your invoice(s) from Warchouse Direct attached.

[attachment: WDInvoice.PDIY]




IABEHOUSE IIRECT INVOICE

WORKPLACE SOLUTIONS 6/26/2018 3938500-0
2001 8. Mount Prospect Rd. DATE NUMBER .

Des Plaines, TL 60018
(847) 952-1925 Fax: (847) 956-5813
www.warchousedirect.com

Billing Address ' ;

S APBROYED..
425 FAWELL BLVD 425 FAWELL BLVD
cunem ooy ()¢ /1 8/18 - MONTCASCHOWANIEC
Customer Number [ Dept —euiETT T
M108658 425 358413| 6245 5047 NET 30 DAYS VIA

EFT OR CHECK

Replaces Item Pending Credit On Inv# 3934094-0

2 EA 2RCP 617388BK CART,JANITOR W/BAG,BK $159.00 $318.00

SubTotal $318.00
Tax $0.00
Total $318.00

INVOICE REVIEWED
OKAY TO PAY
KATHY STRIPLIN 07/18/14

. THANK YOU FOR YOUR ORDER
Page 1 of 1



Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1089360

Vendor Name: Warehouse Direct, Inc.
Invoice Number: 3934094-2

Invoice Date: 06/26/18

PO Number: P0358413

Check Number: E0068308

Check Amount: $2,917.95

Check Date: 07/19/2018

Department I1D: 00689

Reviewer Name: Kathy Striplin
Voucher Number: V0521003
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



From: ar@warchousedirect.com

Sent: Tue Jun 26 09:58:36 CDT 2018

To: invoicing@cod.edu

&

Subject: Invoices for 6/26/2018 from Warchouse Direct

Please find your invoice(s) from Warchouse Direct attached.

[attachment: WDInvoice.PDI]




i . ; & .
W AREHOUSE DIRECT INVOICE
WORKPLACE SOLUTIONS 6/26/2018 3934094-2
2001 S. Mount Prospeet Rd. DATE NUMBER
Des Plaines, IL 60018

(847) 952-1925 Fax: (847) 956-5815

www,warehousedirect.com

| APPROVED
courceor e 7/ 18/18 - MOXNTEALHOWANIEC

COMMUNITY CRLLEGE 502 COMMUNITY COLLEGE #502
R S S e e
425 FAWELL BLYD 425 FAWELL BLVD
GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137 GLEN ELLYN, IL 80137
Customer Number | Dept Customer F;urchase QOrder I Salesre_p Writer _ Terms 1

M108658 425 358413] 6245 5047 NET 30 DAYS VIA
: EFT OR CHECK

ETA 6/28/18
2 EA 2 NOB 9007629 CARPET SPOTTER,CHEMICAL KIT $645.00 £1,290.00
SubTolal $1,290.00
Tax $0.00
Total $1,280.00
/' "

INVOICE REVIEWED
OKAY TO PAY
KATHY STRIPLIN 07/18/18

THANK YOU FOR YOUR ORDER
Page 1 of 1



