Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1222980

Vendor Name: Landscape Safety Inc.
Invoice Number: AU03312018
Invoice Date: 03/31/18

PO Number: PO356897

Check Number: 0237224

Check Amount: $ 1,000.00

Check Date: 07/11/2018

Department I1D: 00077

Reviewer Name: Linda Hickman
Voucher Number: V0517808
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



From: hullamy@cod.edu

Sent: Tue Jun 26 10:27:30 CDT 2018

To: invoicing@cod.edu

CC: hickmanl@cod.edu,faykris@cod.edu

Subject: ok to pay Greenius/Landscape Safety Invoice PO 356897

Please process attached invoice for payment. Thank you, Amy Hull ----- Original Message----- From:
hullamy(@cod.edu Sent: Tuesday, June 26, 2018 10:23 AM To: Hull, Amy Subject: Scanned from a Xerox
Multifunction Printer Please open the attached document. It was scanned and sent to you using a Xerox
Multifunction Printer. Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page Multifunction Printer Location: TEC Device
Name: Printer-038

[attachment: Scanned from a Xerox Multifunction Printer.pdf]



GREEHUS

Formally-LS Training

2026 Oxford Street East
London, Ontario N5V 2Z8

Phone Number: (877) 482-2323
Fax Number: (B77) 301-6363

Sold to:
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