Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1089360

Vendor Name: Warehouse Direct, Inc.
Invoice Number: 3862396-0

Invoice Date: 04/13/18

PO Number: B0355009

Check Number: E0066721

Check Amount: $ 290.88

Check Date: 04/25/2018

Department I1D: 00689

Reviewer Name: Kathy Striplin
Voucher Number: V0509304
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



> B
WAREHOUSE DIRECT INVOICE
WORKPLACE SOLUTIONS 4/13/2018 3862396-0
2001 S. Mount Prospect Rd. DATE NUMBER
Des Plaines, IL 60018
(847) 952-1925 Fax: (847) 956-5815
www.warehousedirect.com

APPROVED
A4/ 1.8/18 - MONICA GHOWANIE (‘

COLLEGE QFE DUIPAGCE

COMMUNITY COLLEGE 502 COMMUNITY COLLEGE #502
425 FAWELL BLVD 425 FAWELL BLVD
GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137 GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137
Customer Number | Dept Customer Purchase Order Salesrep Writer Terms
M108658 425 BO355009 6245 5047 NET 30 DAYS VIA
EFT OR CHECK
Order|UM | BO [Ship| MFG |  Stock Number | Description | Unit Price |~ Extended
2 EA 2 SPA 350615 CLEANER,GREEN SOLUTIONS $112.94 $225.88

SubTotal $225.88
Tax $0.00
Total  $225.88

INVOICE REVIEWED
OKAY TO PAY
KATHY STRIPLIN 04/18/18

THANK YOU FOR YOUR ORDER
Page 1 of 1




From: ar@warehousedirect.com

Sent: Fri Apr 13 09:59:57 CDT 2018

To: invoicing@cod.edu

B

Subject: Invoices for 4/13/2018 from Warehouse Direct

Please find your invoice(s) from Warehouse Direct attached.

[attachment: WDInvoice.PDF]



Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1089360

Vendor Name: Warehouse Direct, Inc.
Invoice Number: IN262491

Invoice Date: 04/10/18

PO Number:

Check Number: E0066721

Check Amount: $ 290.88

Check Date: 04/25/2018

Department I1D: 00689

Reviewer Name: Kathy Striplin
Voucher Number: V0509375
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



®

Service Invoice

WAaREHOUSE DIRECT

WORKPLACE SOLUTIONS Wit pels
i : IN262491
2001 S Mount Prospect Road Des Plaines, IL 60018 Involce N“:b: o4 ;1?]?20 ib
P: 847-631-0351 anes
Account Number: M108658]
PO Number:
Somrieioheiey $65.00
APPROVED
Bill To: A
College of DuPage | & | 4N
asado@ A/ 18/18 - MONIEA-CHOWANIEL |
Glen Ellyl, IL 60137 - -
P e QUS00  _taid0Dp ) | 051072018
~ Call Equipment Serial v A, v v v : Labor Travel Materials Other Total
 Number  Number ; Namber . Make/Mosel [ (clame Charg Charges: Charges Charges

| 10125650000236  WINDSOR - CHARIOT IVAC 34TV~

" scixserl . Eopoice

Labor Charges

Cody Carter 04/09/2018 2:40 pm 347 pm CDT

Credit expires in 12 months
Please Remit Payment to:
Warehouse Direct

2001 South Mount Prospect Road
DesPlaines IL, 60018

| INVOICE REVIEWED
OKAY TO PAY
KATHY STRIPLIN 04/18/18

Page 1 of 1



From: JaklynKroll@warehousedirect.com

Sent: Wed Apr 11 11:04:55 CDT 2018

To: invoicing@cod.edu

CC: chowaniecm157@cod.edu

Subject: Please see the attached invoices from Warehouse Direct

Good morning,
Please see the attached invoices from Warehouse Direct .

Your account has been updated with the correct email for invoice delivery :)
Let me know if there are any additional questions or concerns .

Thank you and have a great rest of your day !

Jakie Kroll

Customer Service Associlate

%l
L

Warehouse Direct-Workplace solutions

2001 S. Mount Prospect Rd., Des Plaines, IL 60018

Ph# 847-631-7438 / Fax# 847-956-5815

Email; jaklynkroll@warehousedirect.com

After 5 p.m. please e-mail customerservice@warehousedirect.com

Notice of Confidentiality to recipient of this Electronic Message: ThisElectronic Message contains confidential information of Warehouse Direct
and/or itsclients. It isintended only for the person(s) named, and the information in such Electronic Message shall only be used by the person(s)
named for the purposeintended andfor noother purpose. Any use, distribution, copying or disclosure by any other persons or bythe person(s) named
butfor purposes other thanthe intended purpose, is prohibited. Ifyou havereceived this communication in error, please notify us by phone at
800-858-1180 and then destroy original Electronic Message.



WaRreErnoUSE DIRECT *
WORKPLACE SOLUTIONS




From: marekr(@cod.edu

Sent: Fri Apr 13 13:32:30 CDT 2018
To: invoicing@cod.edu

B

Subject: Attached Document




