Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1089608

Vendor Name: Stivers Staffing Services
Invoice Number: 8004818

Invoice Date: 03/24/18

PO Number: B0355721

Check Number: E0066583

Check Amount: $ 718.00

Check Date: 04/18/2018

Department 1D: 00374

Reviewer Name: Kelly Hannapel
Voucher Number: V0508112
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice
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From: holmwoode@cod.edu

Sent: Thu Apr 05 13:17:39 CDT 2018
To: invoicing@cod.edu

B

Subject: DC - Stivers Inv #8004818

Hello, Please process the attached Stivers invoice, # 8004818, for payment against BO #355721. If there are
any questions, please do not hesitate to contact me. Thank you, Elizabeth Holmwood Academic Outreach
Programs | Administrative Assistant College of DuPage BIC 3B11, 425 Fawell Blvd., Glen Ellyn, IL 60137
630-942-4811 | holmwoode@cod.edu ----- Original Message----- From: holmwoode@cod.edu Sent: Thursday,
April 05, 2018 1:15 PM To: Holmwood, Elizabeth Subject: DC - Stivers Inv #8004818 Please open the
attached document. It was scanned and sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction Printer. Attachment File Type:
pdf, Multi-Page Multifunction Printer Location: IC3B11WC3655 Device Name: Printer-308

[attachment: DC - Stivers Inv _8004818.pdf]



