
 Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1089224
Vendor Name: Siemens Industry Inc.
Invoice Number: 54444973588
Invoice Date: 04/01/18
PO Number: B0353339
Check Number: E0066529
Check Amount: $ 28,233.00
Check Date: 04/12/2018
Department ID: 00705
Reviewer Name: Kathy Striplin
Voucher Number: V0508056
Redaction Type: Other
Document Type: AP Invoice
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SIEMENS 
CustPO No 
347695 

Sales Order No 
2600002936 

Bill To: 

Cust PO Date 
08/22/2016 

Sales Ord Date 
10/29/2005 

I 
i 

Qw,tatio1 No 

Lock Box No 

I 

Invoice 
Invoice No 
5444973588 

Customer No 
30067308 

Date 
04/01/2018 
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Remit check payments to: 

SIEMENS INDUSTRY, INC. 
C/0 Citibank (Bldg Tech) 
PO Box 2134 
Carol Stream IL 60132-2134 

Delivery#: 

INCO Terms: Prepaid and Add 
PLANT 

Remit Incoming Wires To: 

Carrier/Route: Best Way 

Line 
Item Material Number/Descri lion 

80 A7F90009001 
Building Automation Svc Agreement 2 of 3 
ECCN: EAR99 

Customer PIN: COD 425 FAWELL BLVD 

Contract no 2600002936 
04/01/2018 TO 06/30/2018 

Notes: 

Contact: Customer Service 

Siemens lnduslry, Inc. 
Chicago Sales Office 
585 Slawin Court 
Mount Prospect IL 60056 
Phone: (847)803-2700 
Fax: (847)803-2733 

Customer PO item #: 000080 

G&A 
State Taxes 

U/M 
PC 

Remit Incoming ACH's To: 

Invoice 
a 

Unit 
Price 

28,233.00 
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Total 
Price 
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Marek, Robert 

From: Striplin, Kathy 
Sent: 
To: 

Friday, April 6, 2018 9:55 AM 
Marek, Robert 

Subject: 
Attachments: 

Bobby, 

FW: Siemens Invoice 
Siemens.PDF 

The PO number is BO 353339, Dept. 00705. 

Thank you. 

Kathy 

Kathy Striplin 

College of DuPage 

Facility Operations and Construction / 425 Fawell Blvd / Glen Ellyn, IL 60137 

striplin@cod.edu /o: 630-942-4082 /f: 630-942-2136 

From: Marek, Robert 
Sent: Friday, April 06, 2018 9:34 AM 
To: Striplin, Kathy <striplin@cod.edu> 
Subject: Siemens Invoice 

Hi Kathy, 

Can you please let me know the PO# to use for the attached Siemens invoice? The one listed on the invoice was an old 

one. 

Thanks! 

Bobby Marek 
Accounts Payable Team Leader 
Cash Disbursements/Payroll Department 

College of DuPage 
425 Fawell Blvd I SRC 2132 I Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599 

phone 630-942-2229 I marekr@cod.edu 
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