
 Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1452336
Vendor Name: SKILLS USA INC ILLINOIS
Invoice Number: S43422
Invoice Date: 03/06/18
PO Number: 
Check Number: 0235011
Check Amount: $ 360.00
Check Date: 04/11/2018
Department ID: 02638
Reviewer Name: 
Voucher Number: V0500927
Redaction Type: FERPA
Document Type: AP Invoice-3 Way/Pre-Approved

Document Below



College of DuPage Accounts Payable JI.I) \ TJ~ 1"m lk, . 
~:;:,:;·~ · .. ,O;.lJJlfl.llJl,,; .. JlflllElf rulJ.LlREK .. 
documentation (e. invoice or agreement}. Please refer to Vendor Payment - Check Request Procedure No. 10-65 

Date: 
Vendor ID: 

Invoice Number 

$43422· · 

-543422· 

~ .', 

· ·iis1201a 
1452336 

P.O. Number/ 
Req. Number 

Check the appropriate box below and sign 

Fund 

06 

, 01 
- ·r, 

Fune. Dept. Object Object Descrlp. 

10 02638 ~~] Conference/Meeting Exp- Local 

,10 00049 dsso3_0.02m Mileage o of Olsl/0 of Stale 

Grand Total 

Attach supporting 

Amount 

s . : · · :270,00 

$ , ·90.00 
-. ; " 

s 360.00 

0 ~ the undersigned, hereby certify that the goods/services, for which payment is herein requested, have been provided in a satisfactory condition/manner. 
Consequently, payment is appropriate at this time. · 

, I • b _ ~ the undersigned, hereby certify that the goods/services, for which payment is herein requested, have not yet been provlded. The.flrst approver 
indicated below will notify the Accounts Payable Office in writing when the goods/services have been delivered in a satisfactory condition/manner . 

Payee Name: 

Payee Address: 

Desert tlon on Check: 

·Skill;USA Illinois" State Office '.' 

·conference Registration 
PO Box 1029 
Pekin, 11:61555-1029 

2018 SklllsUSA Illinois Contesta~i°fees for College of DuPage_Cosmetology,St~dents: 
--:,, ·· '• • ~ ·'.:,:'_ l .. " ·~;,t. 

Approvals: 

Prepared By: 

Signature: 

Payment Due: 

Board Approved Date: 

,:'~c~ 
~O h-1..~~l\c s 
', • ' 

.,., ~. 

. other 
Instructions: 

I 

A~proved By: 

Signature: 

Approved By:· 

Signature: 

. · .. -A~,,,c:t &c..-',, a' 5 o J-- . ·· . 
Note - Please call j<M+1 ! 11 i I lg-to pick.up check. All support 

. , • ,,. · ;-documents ar;·auacned: . · : , 

·oate:3 

Approved By Divis.ion VP: Donn a 
Signature: 

Return Approved Request and All Supporting Documents to: Accounts Payable (SRC 2132 A), acctpay@cod.edu 
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._ . 



Gay, Anna 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

01-100)()()49-5503002 

Chuck 

Boone, Charles E. 
Wednesday, March 07, 2018 12:43 PM 
Gay, Anna 
RE: Skills USA 

---··- --·- ·--- -··- ·•~·- ·-·--··- -·- ·-·--·· ---···- --·-·---•--·---- ----·- ·-·-··~7.-·~- ---·- ~--..... --- ·---- •·--------•------- ·- -··------···--•·--•----
From: Gay, Anna 
Sent: Wednesday, March 7, 2018 11:49 AM 
To: Boone, Charles E.<boonec@cod.edu> 
Subject: RE: Skills USA 

Registration, Food and Hotel 

.:'Anna (jay- · --
Program Suy_port S_peciali.st: 

Cosrnetofogy, Cuunary, Jiosyita{ity, Interior Vesign, 
_Tash ion Stud1es, 5_peecfi. Comm.unications 

Co{Tege of 'DuPage 'BJC 1441 

425 .raweff 'B(vc,[ 

Glen 'E((vn, IL 60137 
630-942-2502 

From: Boone, Charles E. 
Sent: Wednesday, March 07, 2018 11:48 AM 

To: Gay, Anna <gayanna@cod.edu> 
Subject: RE: Skills USA 

Is this for travel expenses or for a registration fee or? Break it down for me. 

Chuck 

1 

------ ----- ------- ---------- -------· - --



/ From: Gay, Anna 
Sent: Wednesday, March 7, 2018 11:12 AM 
To: Boone, Charles E.<boonec@cod.edu> 
Subject: Skills USA 

For just state the estimate is $400 

..'Anna <gay 
'P rog ,-am Su}1yort 5_pecialist: 

Cvsmetofogy, Cul1nary, .1-fo.~pi.tafhy, Interior 'Desi[:Tn, 
J'asffron. Studies, Sj7eech. Conrm:unications 

ColTege of Du'Page 'BIC 1441 

425 .r awe(( Bh 1ll 
§{en. 'Ellyn, IL 60137 

630-942-2502 

2 



\ .. 
REQUISITION FORM 

FY: J J Name of Grant: 

COLLEGE OF DuPAGE 
Community College District NO. 502 

Glen Ellyn, IL 60137 

VENDOR NUMBER ACCOUNT NAME 

/1./5~?,~L 
VENDOR NAME 

5ki-l\s LlSA 
VENDOR ADDRESS 

po ~o~ 1niCt 

Pe.k-,"' IL ~l~S~ 

I 

' 

I 

DEPT. 

1 C I 10 

Ofti/l 
2 

Activity Number: t2- A ~ 
(if applicable} 

UNIT/SUB OBJECT/SUB 

000 "-lq ~~o '!oo ~ 
b ;).,{p ~e> 6 ?~, 00/ 

$AMOUNT 

C/0 
~7[) 

DEPARTMENT NAME D3f ·tu;.D / l P AGtt - ~St'Y1 p 
RAONSIBLE PERSON(PLEASE PRINT) - PHONEEXT. 

n n d t~t'l.J....J ~5:J .l . I DELIVERTO(REQUIRED) ....J PHONE EXT. BUILDING ROOM 

CONTACT PHONE A~Si ,~etDirector DATE 

70'3, 14 ·5t/l.5 - ~I' /~.., 
TERMS APPR~Vice President-When required (see #4 Below) 

3-g-\i ~~-.A --&.wA-
-

UNIT COST TOTAL COST & DISCOUNT 
ITEM NO. QTY. UNIT MANUF.# DESCRIPTION, s1zekoLoR, CATALOG NO. 

1 L-\ S+u..~U'\-t "Re.o. isk4'll, qo.oo 3lo6.00 ~k, ll~· l t~ 

2 

~\left.• 4i:t. 

3 

4 

5 

6 ; 

7 

1. Fill out completely, if Perkins, leave Acct No blank. 

2. Fill in vendor information_ If new vendor, obtain a 
vendor number through th~ new vendor process. 

3. Requisitions must be approved by appropriate 
Dean, Assoc. Dean or Director before being pro­
cessed. 

cs""~"/~').. 

\ 

5. Requisitions amounting to but not exceeding $4999 
' will be processed at the discretion of the Purchasing 

Dept. Requisitions from $5000-$14,999 will have a 
minimum of 3 verbal quotes solicited by Purchasing. 
Requisitions from $15,000-$24,999 will have 3 written 
quotes solicited by Purchasing. 

4. Requisitions for out of State travel (air, bus or car) 6. Any item or items to a single vendor exceeding 
must be approved by your respective Vice-President $25,000 must be formally bid. 
before being processed on the Pre-Travel forms, 

Updated 7/25/2013 
·> . ' 



j 

t : 
l 

. SkillsUSA Illinois State ~eadership & Skills 
I . 

Invoice#: S43422 
Invoice Date: 3/6/2018 

Invoice Amount: $360.00 
Print Date: 03/06/2018 

PO#: 

:El= 
SkillsUS-\.. 

Bill To 

Accounts Payable 

College of DuPage Business & Technology 

425 Fawell Blvd TEC 1057 

Glen Ellyn, IL 60137 

Billing Email: victorme@cod.edu 

Payment Information: 

c~~t761aie . 
I 

School/ Chapter I Training Program 
i · l College of DuPage Business & Technology 

425 Fawell Blvd TEC 1057 

Glen Ellyn, IL 60137 

Inv. Created By: victorme@cod.edu 
Melissa Victor 
victorme@cod.edu 
Cosmetology 

Checks payable to: "SkillsUSA Illinois, Inc." mailed c/o State . Event Information: 
Conference Registration 

P.O. Box 1029 Dates: 4/19/17 - 4/21/17 

Pekin, IL 61555-1029 Bank ofSpringfield Center 

membership@skillsusaillinois.org Springfield IL 

Please send State Conference Registration Fees to the SkillsUSA Illinois State Office: SkillsUSA Illinois Inc., c/o State 
Conference Registration, P.O. Box 1029, Pekin, IL 61555-1029. Checks should be made out to: "SkillsUSA Illinois, Inc." 

Please take care to see that your school's business office does not mistakenly send these payments to the National 
SkillsUSA payment address. The only payment that should;be sent to National SkillsUSA is your school's Membership 
Fee. Send all other Fees to: SkillsUSA Illinois Inc., P.O. Box 1029, Pekin, IL 61555-1029. 

I 
Name Fee Item Qty Amount Extended - Contestant Fee 1 $90:00 $90.00 - Contestant Fee 1 $90.00 $90.00 - Contestant Fee 1 $90.00 $90.00 

Contestant Fee 1 $90.00 $90.00 

Number Of Registrants: 4 Total Amount Due: $360.00 

Payments 

Payment Type Document# Date Amt Paid Applied 

Totals Payments: $0.00 

ll r, 
I: 1 !i 
, ; 



Marek, Robert 

From: Gay, Anna 
Sent: 
To: 

Friday, April 6, 2018 8:43 AM 
Marek, Robert 

Subject: FW: Skil ls Account 

He said yes! 

.'A.nna (gay 
'Proaram Suyyort Syeciafist: 

Cosmeto{oay, Culinary, Jiosyitailty, Interior 'Desian, 
:fasfi.ion Studies, S_peecfi Communications 

Co{Ceae of VuPaae 13IC 1441 
425 :fawe{{ 13(vr£. 
<gCen 'E{{yn, IL 60137 

630-942-2502 

From: Boone, Charles E. 
Sent: Friday, April 06, 2018 8 :35 AM 
To: Gay, Anna <gayanna@cod.edu> 
Subject: RE: Skills Account 

That's fine. 

Chuck 

From: Gay, Anna 
Sent: Friday, April 6, 2018 8 :08 AM 
To: Boone, Charles E.<boonec@cod.edu> 
Subject: FW: Skills Account 

What says you? 

. .'A.nna (gay 
1'roaram Suyyort SyeciaCist: 

Cosmeto{oay, Cuf1nary, JiosyitaCity, Interior 'Desian, 
:fasfiion Studies, S_peecfi Communications 

Co{{eae of 1Ju'Paae 'BIC 1441 

425 :fawelT 13{vr£. 
(gfen 'E{{yn, IL 60137 

630-942-2502 

From: Marek, Robert 
Sent: Thursday, April 05, 2018 9:15 AM 
To: Gay, Anna <gayanna@cod.edu> 
Subject: RE: Skills Account 

1 



Can you ask him if he would approve using 01-20-00423-5501001 (Conference/Meeting Exp) to pay the $90 
instead? The 01-20-00423-5503001 is for out-of-state travel. Thanks ! 

Bobby Marek 
Accounts Payable Team Leader 
Cash Disbursements/Payroll Department 

College of DuPage 
425 Fawell Blvd I SRC 2132 I Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599 
phone 630-942-2229 I marekr@cod.edu 

From: Gay, Anna 
Sent: Thursday, April 5, 2018 7:40 AM 
To: Marek, Robert <marekr@cod.edu> 
Subject: FW: Skills Account 

. .'An na (jay 
Program Suyyort SyeciaCist: 

Cosmeto{ogy, Cuunary, JfosyitaCity, Interior 'Design, 
:fasfzion Studies, Syeecfi Communications 

Coffege of 1Ju'Page 13IC 1441 
425 :[awe{{ 13{va. 
(_j[en 'E{[yn7 IL 60137 

630-942-2502 

From: Boone, Charles E. 
Sent: Wednesday, April 04, 2018 3:39 PM 
To: Gay, Anna <gayanna@cod.edu> 
Subject: RE: Skills Account 

OK, so this is an advance and not a reimbursement...use account 01-20-00423-5503001 

Chuck 

From: Gay, Anna 
Sent: Wednesday, April 4, 2018 3:06 PM 

To: Boone, Charles E. <boonec@cod.edu> 
Subject: RE: Skills Account 

Mileage line will not count. It must correlate more to a line for registration. Because it is a check request the policy 
rest ricts them from using that line . 

. .'Anna (jay 
1Jrogrmn Suyyort SyeciaCist: 

Cosmetofogy, Cuunary, Jfosyitauty, Interior 'Design, 
:fashion Studies, Syeecfi Communications 

Co{[ege of 1Ju'Page 13IC 1441 

425 :fawelT 13{va. 
(_j[en 'E{[y-~ IL 60137 

2 



From: Boone, Charles E. 
Sent: Wednesday, April 04, 2018 3:03 PM 
To: Gay, Anna <gayanna@cod.edu> 
Subject: RE: Skills Account 

You see what I know of the account. Call Bobby and ask what is the problem. Last time I checked, a room in Springfield 

didn't run over $1000 ... 

Chuck 

From: Gay, Anna 
Sent: Wednesday, April 4, 2018 3:00 PM 
To: Boone, Charles E. <boonec@cod.edu> 
Subject: RE: Skills Account 

This one is in Springfield. It is the registration. $90 

.'Anna (jay 
'Program Suyyort Syeciafist: 

Cosmetofogy, Cuunary, J-fosyitauty, Interior 'Design, 
:fashion Studies, Syeecfi Communications 

Co{{ege of 'DuPage 'BIC 1441 
425 :fawe{{'B[v£ 
(j{en "E{{yn, IL 60137 

630-.942-2502 

From: Boone, Charles E. 
Sent: Wednesday, April 04, 2018 2:59 PM 
To: Gay, Anna <gayanna@cod.edu> 
Subject: RE: Skills Account 

How much do you need? The account reads: 

I 01-10-00049-5503002 II Cosmetology : Mileage O of Dist/O of State II ~ II 0.00 II 0.00 II 0.00 II 999.96 I 

Chuck 

From: Gay, Anna 
Sent: Wednesday, April 4, 2018 12:43 PM 
To: Boone, Charles E.<boonec@cod.edu> 
Subject: Skills Account 

Importance: High 

Hi Chuck, 

Since- does not meet the Perkins specifications, you gave me an account to pay her portion out of---Bobby 
from AP says there isn't enough money in that account. Do have another option? The original given to me 
was 01 10 00049 5503002 

3 



Thank you so much! 

.'Anna <gay 
Program Suyyort Syeciafist: 

Cosmetofogy, cuanary, J-fosyitafity, Interior 1Jesign, 
:fashion Studies, Syeecfi Communications 

Co{{ege of 1JuTage 'BIC 1441 

425 :fawe{( 'B{vcl 
<gfen E{{yn, IL 60137 

630-942-2502 

4 



S43422 
S43422 

1452336 

V0500927 
V0500927 

4 Contestant Fees 
4 Contestant Fees 

PAY ONLY THREE HUNDRED S IXTY AND 00/100 DOLLARS 

SKILLS USA INC ILLINOIS 
PO Box 1029 
C/0 State Conf Regis tration 
Pekin IL 61555-1029 

04/11/2018 

0610026385501001 
0120004235501001 

04/11/2018 

/ 

0235011 

0235011 

270.00 
90.00 

360.00 

$* •*****360 . 00 


