Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1539957

Vendor Name: Stylus Publishing Llc
Invoice Number: STY 1505224
Invoice Date: 06/22/20

PO Number: P0370081

Check Number: E0080879

Check Amount: $ 211.20

Check Date: 07/14/2020

Department 1D: 00788

Reviewer Name: Barbara Groves
Voucher Number: V0631921
Redaction Type: None

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



From: grovesb16(@cod.edu - ™

i% vstigodeds . APPROVED
Subject: FW: Book Request - PO Included () 7/() (;/2 " - Nl j‘ l‘ l‘ (: lJ l{fl‘ls
e

Barb Groves

Assistant to the Provost

Office of the Provost

College of DuPage | 425 Fawell Blvd | BIC3400 | Glen Ellyn, IL60137
630-942-2005 (ph) | 630-942-3925 (fax)

From: Linda Clalﬁi_o <linda@booksintl.com>

Sent: Monday, Jjine 29, 2020 10:51 A T r h | ? "‘ r "‘ T ;!
To: Groves, Barliara <grovesbl6@coddy > 284 b 4 Y
d

Subject: RE: Bodk Request - PO Include

OKAY TO PAY

= | BARBARA GROVES 07/01/20

From: Groves, Barbara [mailto:grovesbi6@cod.edu ]
Sent: Monday, June 29, 2020 11:43 AM

To: Linda Claudio

Subject: RE: Book Request - PO Included

Hi Linda,

Thank you for sending the invoice, however we'll have an issue paying multiple invoices, as our PO for the 9 books were listed
on one order. Isit possible to issue one invoice for the total amount, as referenced on the PO? I'm sorry for the hassle and
inconvenience. Please let me know.

Thank you,

Barb Groves APPROVED

Assistant to the Provost

07/06/20.- MARK CURTIS

College of DuPage | 425 Fawell Bivdj| B
630-942-2005 (ph) | 630-942-3925 (e

From: Linda Claudio <linda@booksintl.com>
Sent: Friday, June 26, 2020 8:13 AM

To: Groves, Barbara <groveshl6@cod.edu>
Subject: RE: Book Request - PO Included



HI Barb,
Attached are the invoices for the orders that will be shipping out.

Thank you,
Linda®

From: Groves, Barbara [mailto:grovi b |

Sent: Thursday] June 25, 2020 12: 3!»NO‘T()]( l'l l{ ]1 ‘Tlli “T ]1 l)
To: Linda Claud

Subject: RE: Book Request - PO Included

- OKAY TO PAY
s RIRIEARA -GROYES:0'7/01/2 0

approaching thelend of their fiscal year on the 30th and it is important that we have the books and invoices by June 30th.

Please send me th

Please let me know if you have any questions.

Ship both books to: ‘ Ship both books to: Ship both books to: Ship both books to:

Best Regards,

Barb Groves
Assistant to the Provost
Office of the Provost

College of DuPage | 425 Fawell Bivd | BIC 340D | Glen Ellyn, IL601371‘I’]’1{"‘711 l)

630-942-2005 (ph) | 630-942-3925 (fax)

rrom: s ciouso snceacaicnicons | O OG220 - MARIK CURTIS

Sent: Monday, June 22, 2020 3:01 PM
To: Groves, Barbara <grovesh16@cod.edu>
Subject: RE: Book Request

Thank you. | am off Tomorrow and Wed. But | will be back here Thursday and Friday.

Just in case you get it to me after today

Take Care,
Linda

From: Groves, Barbara [mailto:grovesb16@cod.edu ]
Sent: Monday, June 22, 2020 3:58 PM



Sent: Monday, June 22, 2020 3:58 PM
To: Linda Claudio
Subject: RE: Book Request

Thank you! I'll process this into our system for a purchase order right away.

Barb Groves

Assistant to the Provost

Office of the Provost

College of DuPage | 425 Fawell Blvd | BIC3400 | Glen Ellyn, IL60137
630-942-2005 (ph) | 630-942-3925 (fax)

From: Linda Claudio <linda@booksintl.com>

Sent: Monday, June 22, 2020 2:55 PM

To: Groves, Barbara <grovesbl6@cod.edu>

Subject:RE: BOOK Request 2

“r INVOICE REVIEWED

| progessed this with an amount of all the invoices.

Ifyou or the Provost can send me the Po‘t)aﬁ?‘t‘él g(!l!‘a) perl)ﬁjlc¥;.

5 'BARBARA GROVES 07/01/20

To: Lmda Claudio
Subject: RE: Book Request

Hi Linda,

~

The Provost would like to ship them with ground shipping. Wouldyou please send one surj&l’.{l’l{()‘rlg ])
Thank you for your help!
07/06/20 - MARK CURTIS
A\

Barb Groves

Assistant to the Provost
Office of the Provost
College of DuPage | 425 Fawell Blvd | BIC3400 | Glen Ellyn, IL60137
630-942-2005 (ph) | 630-942-3925 (fax)

From: Linda Claudio <linda@booksintl.com>
Sent: Monday, June 22, 2020 1:35 PM

To: Groves, Barbara <grovesb16@cod.edu>
Subject: RE: Book Request

Thank you so much.

Take Care,
Linda












Stylus Publishing, LLC

P.O. Box 605
Herndon, VA 20172-0605
(703) 661-1581

ACCOUNT NUMBER

B1340

Please Reference
Both Numbers
When Making Payments

INVOICE NUMBER

STY1505224

Vil (800) 232-0223 FEDERALCTD# 25
FAX: (70 YEY - *71 1 5
INVOICE REVIEWED
J Ad | Y| V|
SOLD TO SHIP TO
COLLEG G r rmv ‘_) DUPAGE -
ATTN: A F EMIC AFFAIRS
425 FAW 42 L BLVD
GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137 GLEN ELLYN, IL 60137
b | Y LY - é
T )
ER
\106/22/2020 370081 UPS _Ground NET 30 J
ISBN # Qry LocatioN TITLE List Price DISC AMOUNT
9781620363164 4 TEACH STUDENTS HOW TO LEARN PB 32.00 20.00% 102.40
9781620367568 5 TEACH YOURSELF HOW TO LEARN P 19.95 20.00% 79.80
DO NOT SHIP! ! 11| loslusfoefesfusfosfuseslusfsfusfusfsfusfesfustusfesfuslefsusfenfuusfslu el ~
)PROYE]
* :'r!.i !‘:‘: "Ry .i‘: R REY 4.: a:!': Thdkh®
o4 3 Jeé h | 4 Al q
07/06/20= YPARK-CURTIS
A\
##%%% Tndicates non-shipping item.
Main ware ALL RETURNS MUST BE MADE TO: SUBTOTAL 182.20
Qty: 9, wt; 5.30# .
Currency of settlement: USD Eetlumg[)ljpia]ﬂmeﬂlt_c SHIPPING & HANDLING 29.00
tylus Publishing, ;
22880 Quicksilver Drive SALES. 1A% o0
Dulles, VA 20166 AMOUNT DUE 211.20
Shortages and defective books should be reported within 15 days. AMOUNT PAID 0.00
| BALANCE DUE $ 211.20 |
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